27/07/2021

M Gmail

Fwd: Inquiry Sensors R17-A

3 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message --—--—-----

Gmail - Fwd: Inquiry Sensors R17-A

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Mon, Jul 26, 2021 at 2:28 PM

From: Michaela Kramperova <m.kramperova@chromservis.eu>

Date: Mon, 26 Jul 2021 at 14:26
Subject: Inquiry Sensors R17-A

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk <sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk>
Cc: Hana Zelenkova <h.zelenkova@chromservis.eu>

Dear Sarah,

could you please send me the actual price and delivery conditions for following sensor :

Oxygen sensor R-17A 3 pcs

Thank you very much in advance
Best regards

Michaela

Michaela Kramperova
Chromservis s.r.o.

Jakobiho 327

109 00 Prague 10 — Petrovice
Czech Republic

Telefon: +420 274 021 215
Fax: +420 274 021 220

E-mail: m.kramperova@chromservis.eu

www.chromservis.eu
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O cHROMSERVIS

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Jul 26, 2021 at 3:02 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

To: Michaela Kramperova <m.kramperova@chromservis.eu>

Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Michaela,

Please accept my reply.

The cost of 3 x R-17A sensors would be $42.00 each and they are currently in stock.
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]

Michaela Kramperova <m.kramperova@chromservis.eu> Mon, Jul 26, 2021 at 3:07 PM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Hana Zelenkova <h.zelenkova@chromservis.eu>

Dear Zoey,

many thanks for prompt reply.

What will be the shipping_cost for 3 sensors, please ?
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Thank you in advance
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