
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Advice and cost of oxygen sensor.

1 message

ashley clough <apsmarine29@gmail.com> 21 July 2021 at 10:04
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Perfect how do i go about ordering and paying for said sensor?
Happy to do a bank transfre straight away. 


Many thanks for the quick responce. 


On 21/07/2021 10:02, Ryan Swaine wrote:


Hi Ashley

I can confirm the R-41V is the correct sensor.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 21 Jul 2021 at 09:55,
ashley clough <apsmarine29@gmail.com> wrote:


Good morning Ryan, Please find attached some images of
the current fitted o2 sensor. Ive also
copied a section
form the LMNT blender page which may be of some use. Just
want to double check
the R-41V is the correct replacement
before placing the order. Many thanks 


O2
Sensor
O2 medical
sensor; electrical connector 3,5 mm, output signal 13 to
17 mV.
Suitable to
diving analyzers










On 20/07/2021 17:24, Ryan Swaine wrote:


Dear Ashley


Thank you for your enquiry via our sister company
Viamed.
Please accept my reply from Vandagraph,
aswe take care of the sales of products for
the Scuba
industry. 


We would be happy to offer you our trade pricing,
please find the total cost below:


R-41V = £35 each
Postage by 1st class Signed = £6
Total with VAT = £49.20


The R-41V sensors are available from stock and we
would endeavour to dispatch
orders as soon as they are
confirmed. We would ask for prepayment, this can be
done
by bank transfer or credit card.



http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:apsmarine29@gmail.com
http://www.nitrox-trimix.com/assets/img/produits/cellule-o2.jpg


Please let me know if you have any questions or if
you would like to proceed with an
order.


Kind regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117





----------
Forwarded message ---------

From: ashley clough <apsmarine29@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, 20 Jul 2021 at 17:10

Subject: Advice and cost of oxygen sensor.

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>






Good afternoon, would it be possibel
pleaae to have price shipped to the
address
below for the following partnumber
to suit my LMNT diving oxgen blender. Part
no
0110041 Class R -41v

Many thanks


-- 





-- 

Regards



Ashley



A Clough.

APS Marine centre

APS Marine Training

Unit 3, Clearway Garage,

London Rd (A30) Firsdown.

Salisbury Wilts.

SP4 6DT

07486 703986 - 07895 472201

www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk

www.aps-marine.co.uk



Privileged/in confidence information may
be contained in this message. If you
have
received this e-mail in error,
please destroy all copies in your
possession or control
and kindly notify
the sender by reply e-mail. The
addressee (or individual responsible
for
delivery of the message to such person)
may not forward, disclose or copy this
e-
mail to any third party without the
prior consent of Ashby Powerboat School
marine
centre. Furthermore, Ashby
Powerboat School marine centre does not
accept liability
for any changes made to
this e-mail after it was sent. Please
advise immediately if
you or your
employer do not consent to Internet
e-mail for messages of this kind

-- 





-- 

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:apsmarine29@gmail.com
mailto:sales@viamed.co.uk
http://www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk/
http://www.aps-marine.co.uk/


Regards



Ashley



A Clough.

APS Marine centre

APS Marine Training

Unit 3, Clearway Garage,

London Rd (A30) Firsdown.

Salisbury Wilts.

SP4 6DT

07486 703986 - 07895 472201

www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk

www.aps-marine.co.uk



Privileged/in confidence information may be contained in
this message. If you have received this e-
mail in error,
please destroy all copies in your possession or control
and kindly notify the sender by
reply e-mail. The
addressee (or individual responsible for delivery of the
message to such person)
may not forward, disclose or
copy this e-mail to any third party without the prior
consent of Ashby
Powerboat School marine centre.
Furthermore, Ashby Powerboat School marine centre does
not
accept liability for any changes made to this e-mail
after it was sent. Please advise immediately if you
or
your employer do not consent to Internet e-mail for
messages of this kind

-- 


-- 

Regards


Ashley


A Clough.

APS Marine centre

APS Marine Training

Unit 3, Clearway Garage,

London Rd (A30) Firsdown.

Salisbury Wilts.

SP4 6DT

07486 703986 - 07895 472201

www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk

www.aps-marine.co.uk


Privileged/in confidence information may be contained in this
message. If you have received this e-mail in error,
please
destroy all copies in your possession or control and kindly
notify the sender by reply e-mail. The addressee (or
individual
responsible for delivery of the message to such person) may not
forward, disclose or copy this e-mail to any
third party without
the prior consent of Ashby Powerboat School marine centre.
Furthermore, Ashby Powerboat
School marine centre does not
accept liability for any changes made to this e-mail after it
was sent. Please advise
immediately if you or your employer do
not consent to Internet e-mail for messages of this kind

http://www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk/
http://www.aps-marine.co.uk/
http://www.ashbypowerboatschool.co.uk/
http://www.aps-marine.co.uk/

