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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: oxygen sensor for F60 ventilator

1 message

aparatura medicala <mendelson.ltd@gmail.com> 21 July 2021 at 09:39
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Good morning Kate
Yes, we need 4 pcs (2 packs).
Our VAT number is RO 14540078
Warm regards

În mie., 21 iul. 2021 la 10:46, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> a scris:

Good morning George,


Thank you for your reply.  Would you like a quotation/proforma invoice for 2 x 0110072 (2 x pack of 2) or 4 x
0110020 please?  The pack of two is a matched pair.


Please could I also ask you for your VAT number so I do not have to charge VAT?


Then I will be able to send you a quotation, or a proforma invoice if you prefer.


I await your reply.


Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 20 Jul 2021 at 17:31, aparatura medicala <mendelson.ltd@gmail.com> wrote:


Dear Kate


we need 4 pcs.
 But we need more quickly than few weeks.


Please let me know a quotation.
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