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INFO HASSAN <arwanygeneraltradingllc@gmail.com> 12 July 2021 at 11:27
To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Thanks for the mail, We will like to purchase 20 ofPart number 4710015 Product name
AlcoTrue C Consumer Breathalyser just to establish a business relations with you, Kindly
prepare the proforma invoice and also the payment instructions via bank transfer so that
we can proceed with the purchase and also we will like to arrange for the shipment by
our-self.

Best regards,

Best regards

HASSAN AHMED

Arwany general trading llc

OFFICE 350 Garhoud INDUSTRIAL AREA

DUBAILUAE. Box 8795

Email:arwanygeneraltradinglic@gmail.com

On Mon, Jul 12, 2021 at 11:24 AM Kate Giriffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
wrote:
Good morning Hassan,

Thank you for your enquiry.

| can confirm that part number 4710015 is available. The price is $330 each EXW
when purchasing between 1 and 9. This item is not currently in stock.

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charge, bank charges and
insurance, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a new
account for you.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 12 Jul 2021 at 10:48, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: INFO HASSAN <arwanygeneraltradingllc@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, 12 Jul 2021 at 06:16

Subject: Part number 4710015 Product name AlcoTrue C Consumer Breathalyser
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir/Madam
We are Arwany general trading firm located in Dubai United Arab Emirate,

We are writing to you regarding the Part number 4710015 Product name
AlcoTrue C Consumer Breathalyser you place on advert, we want an
immediate purchase of this particular Part number 4710015 Product name
AlcoTrue C Consumer Breathalyser so we will like to know maybe is still
available for sale and also the final price of it for a possible purchase. Kindly
revert back to us through our email:arwanygeneraltradingllc@gmail.com We
will be waiting for your response as soon as possible.

Best regards

HASSAN AHMED

Arwany general trading llc

OFFICE 350 Garhoud INDUSTRIAL AREA
DUBAI,UAE. Box 8795
Email:arwanygeneraltradinglic@gmail.com
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