M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: RV: | request a quotation OxiQuant S - PERU

1 message

Patricia Irigoyen - Idemed SAC <administracion@idemed.pe> 7 July 2021 at 15:09
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Cc: ventas@idemed.pe, Pamela Leiva Corcuera <leivacorcuerapamela@gmail.com>, John Acufia Valderrama
<john.valderrama@outlook.es>, paul.020695@hotmail.com

Dear Mr. Ryan:

Good morning, today your transfer is being negotiated with the Bank for the balance of US $ 138.28 American dollars.
Sincerely

IDEMED SAC

Estimado Sefior Ryan:

Buenos dias , hoy se esta gestionando con el Banco su transferencia por el saldo de US$138.28 Délares
americanos.

Atentamente

IDEMED SAC

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: miércoles, 7 de julio de 2021 06:25

Para: Patricia Irigoyen - Idemed SAC <administracion@idemed.pe>

CC: ventas@idemed.pe; Pamela Leiva Corcuera <leivacorcuerapamela@gmail.com>; John Acufa Valderrama
<john.valderrama@outlook.es>; paul.020695@hotmail.com

Asunto: Re: RV: | request a quotation OxiQuant S - PERU

Dear Patricia & John
| am pleased to inform you that your payment has arrived, but unfortunately it leaves another shortfall.

The amount received was $6,532.36

If you remove the amount we have added to help cover the bank charges, this leaves a shortfall of $61.22 + the short
fall from your previous order of $77.06

Total = £138.28


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:administracion@idemed.pe
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mailto:john.valderrama@outlook.es
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Would you be able to organise a payment for the shortfall?

Alternatively we can reduce the amount of Analysers from 41 to 40 pieces which will cover the costs and leave a
small credit on your account?

Please advise?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 6 Jul 2021 at 09:26, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Patricia

Thank you very much. Please note that there was a shortfall from your previous order of $77.06, this was
supposed to be included with this payment. Please can you make the additional payment?

Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Mon, 5 Jul 2021 at 19:58, Patricia Irigoyen - I[demed SAC <administracion@idemed.pe> wrote:

Mr. Ryan Swaine:

Good afternoon, a letter of instruction to the Bank is attached to make the transfer of US $ 6,618.58 Dollars to
your client.

Sincerely

Idemed SAC

Sefior Ryan Swaine:

Buenas tardes, se adjunta carta instruccion al Banco opara que eefctien la transferencia de US $ 6,618.58
Délares a su representada.

Atentamente

Idemed SAC

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: martes, 29 de junio de 2021 04:48

Para: ventas@idemed.pe

CC: Patricia Irigoyen - Idemed SAC <administracion@idemed.pe>; Pamela Leiva Corcuera
<leivacorcuerapamela@gmail.com>; John Acufia Valderrama <john.valderrama@outlook.es>
Asunto: Re: RV: | request a quotation OxiQuant S - PERU

Dear Paul

Just to let you know, we have not received the payment yet. International USD payments can take 3 working
days, so if the payment was made at the end of last week it may arrive tomorrow.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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On Tue, 22 Jun 2021 at 20:59, <ventas@idemed.pe> wrote:
Hi Ryan:

By this email, we confirm the requirement of what is requested in the
attached PI.

We will make the respective payment in the course of the week, we will
send you the proof of payment by this means.

Best regards
Paul

Paul Agurto V.
IDEMED SAC
AREA COMERCIAL
Cel: +51 962440520

> De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine
> Enviado el: sabado, 19 de junio de 2021 06:34

> Para: John A. <john.valderrama@outlook.es>

> Asunto: Re: | request a quotation OxiQuant S - PERU

>

> Hi John

>

> | am sorry for the delay in my response, it was very busy yesterday.
>

> Please find a copy of your proforma invoice. Please note that |

> believe it all to be correct, but | need the carriage charges

> checked, unfortunately none of my colleagues are available until

> Monday to do this. | will let you know if there are any amendments
> required.

>

> Please let me know if it is a definite order and | will have the

> stock reserved for you?

>

> | have also added a note regarding the deficit from the precious

> payment, please can you speak with your accounts about this?

>

> Thank you and please have a great weekend,

>

> Ryan

>

>

> Ryan Swaine

> International Sales Manager

> VIAMED

> www.viamed.co.uk<http://www.viamed.co.uk/>

> Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk<mailto:ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>
> Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

> Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

> GDPR / Privacy Policy available at

> www.viamed.co.uk/policy<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy>

>

>

> On Fri, 18 Jun 2021 at 02:12, John A.

> <john.valderrama@outlook.es<mailto:john.valderrama@outlook.es>> wrote:
> Greetings

> Estimated Ryan
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> Please send us the quotation for 41 units of the OxiQuant S, 1 unit

> of the sensor for the OxiQuant S and 1 unit of CR 1/ 2AA 3V Battery
>

> Atte.

>

> John Acuna Valderrama

> EQUIPAMIENTO BIOMEDICO

> MOVIST. +51 956988997 | BITEL +51 967671168

> Email: john.valderrama@outlook.es<mailto:john.valderrama@outlook.es>
>

> Antes de imprimir este mensaje, por favor piensa si es necesario.

> Una tonelada de papel implica la tala de 15 arboles adultos y el

> consumo de 250.000 litros de agua. Un buen Medio Ambiente es

> cuestion de todos.

>

> [22-05-121]
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