07/07/2021 Gmail - Fwd: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 7 July 2021 at 11:24

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>

Date: Wed, 7 Jul 2021 at 10:09

Subject: RE: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

In order to gai time, can youplease provide a Pl with delivery to Tajikistan for :

MAXO2 ME - 0111263 = EUR €450.50 each 5 Pcs.
Invoice to be addressed to our partner MedTech Service:
MedTech Service (Hizmatrasonii Tibbi-Tehniki), LLC
Hayrullo Mirzoev str., building 10,

Dushanbe, Republic of Tajikistan,

Postal index: 734

Phone: +992 911055262

Attn :Kosimova Zebo,

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1704621214050575413%7Cmsg-f%3A170462121...
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Rabieh Bldg. GF.

T:009611835836

F:009611855810.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, July 5, 2021 3:19 PM

To: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>

Subject: Re: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Hi Ali

Please let me know if any of the following would be suitable:

Handi+ - has medical CE, no alarms, the sensor can not be changed, so you would dispose of the device once the
sensor is depleted - part no 0111250 = EUR €133 each EXW

Oxiquant S - no alarms or medical CE - 0111275 = EUR €134.40

If you need the sensor to be separate from the device, then the following may be of interest to you:

MAXO2+AE - Medical CE, no alarms - 0111261 = EUR €256.90

Please let me know your thoughts and if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Sat, 3 Jul 2021 at 10:14, Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

It does not require certificate ,Alarm Is a plus but not mandatory

Ali Shehab

Project Manager/ Tajikistan
Med Concept SAL

Beirut- Lebanon

AlRabieh Building-GF
Ph:009611835836.
F:009611855810

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, July 2, 2021 6:38 PM

To: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>

Subject: Re: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Hi Ali

Does it require Medical use certification? Do you need alarms?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 2 Jul 2021 at 07:51, Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co> wrote:

Dear Ryan ,
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We need the O2 Analyzer, but since we are tied to the budget we get the Greisinger or if you can quote
something similar for cheaper price.

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

Rabieh Bldg. GF.
T:009611835836
F:009611855810.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:52 PM

To: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>

Subject: Re: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Hi Ali

We do not supply the Greisinger GMH3692, do you need the temperature monitoring or do you just need an O2
analyser?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 1 Jul 2021 at 11:58, Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co> wrote:
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Dear Ryan,

| need a proforma invoice with delivery to Dushanbe for:

- Max O2 ME 4Pcs .
-Greisinger GMH3692 Oxygen detector n Air oxygen meter
Manufacturer no.: 606842 11Pcs.

Invoice to be addressed to our partner MedTech Service:

MedTech Service (Hizmatrasonii Tibbi-Tehniki), LLC
Hayrullo Mirzoev str., building 10,

Dushanbe, Republic of Tajikistan,

Postal index: 734

Phone: +992 911055262

Attn :Kosimova Zebo

Looking forward for your soonest reply,

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

Rabieh Bldg. GF.
T:009611835836
F:009611855810.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2021 6:37 PM
To: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>
Subject: Re: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Hi Al
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It is likely to cause you trouble trying to import these devices into Russia, as there is a very expensive
registration requirement there.

MAXO2 ME - 0111263 = EUR €450.50 each EXW

The MAXO2 ME has a galvanic O2 sensor which will require replacement every 1-3 years, depending on
use. However, the design allows you to use it with O2 concentrators or ventilators and incubators for
measuring the gas that is being delivered to the patient. It also has alarms for monitoring.

The Ultramax has an ultrasonic sensor, which does not require replacement. However, the device can
only be used to measure the output of an O2 concentrator.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 25 Jun 2021 at 12:26, Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Kindly advise if you have any quick delivery in Moscow .

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

Rabieh Bldg. GF.

T:009611835836
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F:009611855810.

From: Ali Shehab

Sent: Friday, June 25, 2021 1:36 PM
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Subject: RE: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Dear Rayan,

Can you please provide the pricing for

Part number 0111263 Product name MAXO2 ME Oxygen Monitor GTIN/EAN13 5051826047309

And advise the main difference , | need to check Oxygen concentrators and high flow PSA generators.

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

Rabieh Bldg. GF.
T:009611835836
F:009611855810.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Friday, June 25, 2021 11:32 AM

To: Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co>

Subject: Re: Ultramax O2 analyzer

Hi Al

Thank you very much for your email.

Ultramax Analyser - 0111265 = EUR €442 each EXW
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Please note that the Ultramax is only for testing O2 concentrators and will not perform any other task.

If you would like us to provide a proforma invoice, please can you let me know the complete delivery and
invoice details so we can provide the transport costs?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 25 Jun 2021 at 08:38, Ali Shehab <ashehab@medconcept.co> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Good Morning and hope you are fine.

Kindly | need a quotation for quantity =5 PCs UltraMaxO2 analyzer part Number 0111265 GTIN/
EAN13 5051826009505

Looking forward for your reply,

Best Regards,

Ali Shehab

Project Coordinator/Tajikistan,
Med Concept SAL

Beirut Lebanon,

New Airport Road

Rabieh Bldg. GF.
T:009611835836

F:009611855810.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1704621214050575413%7Cmsg-f%3A170462121...  8/9


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:ashehab@medconcept.co

07/07/2021 Gmail - Fwd: FW: Ultramax O2 analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1704621214050575413%7Cmsg-f%3A170462121...  9/9



