M Gmail

analyzers order
1 message

maurizio@krnica.com <maurizio@krnica.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Hi Ryan,

| would need 2 of this oxygen analyzers

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

1 July 2021 at 15:45

Part number 7910201

Product name Tekox with Quick Ox

My company details
Krnica ronioci doo
Krnica 45a

52208 Krnica, Croatia

Vat hr16860930870

Thanks a lot

Best

Maurizio

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, February 8, 2021 12:36 PM

To: Maurizio Grbac <maurizio@krnica.com>

Subject: Re: MixChek Analyser - SRS67205

Dear Maurizio

Thank you very much.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:maurizio@krnica.com
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

On Sun, 7 Feb 2021 at 18:41, <maurizio@krnica.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

| would need to order following sensors

R33S1 for mixcheck — 2 pcs

R17VAN - 1 pcs

Company details

Krnica ronioci doo
Krnica 45a

52208 Krnica
Croatia

VAT HR 16860930870

Thanks

Maurizio Grbac

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020 1:20 PM

To: Maurizio Grbac <maurizio@krnica.com>

Subject: Re: MixChek Analyser - SRS67205

Hi Maurizio

| am really sorry, we do not supply any sensors that are suitable for use in rebreathers.

There is a shortage of all non medical sensors at the moment, the sensor manufacturers are prioritising on sensors for use in medical ventilators.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 28 Jun 2020 at 14:56, <maurizio@krnica.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
Recently | have been struggling to find O2 cells for my rebreather JJ.

It should be a R17 cell.
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Any chance you can help me with that?
Thanks a lot

Maurizio

Krnicadive Croatia

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 1:48 PM

To: Maurizio Grbac <maurizio@krnica.com>

Cc: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Subject: MixChek Analyser - SRS67205

Dear Maurizio

| am pleased to inform you that your MixChek is now working correctly.
We have replaced the sample tubing, cleaned and calibrated your device.
MixChek Calibration = £15

Sample Tubing = £3

Total excluding carriage = £18

Return carriage by Airmail Tracked & Signed = £16-£17

We will arrange to send the device back to you, please can you let me know if you have any requirements for sensors that you may like to add to the
package?

| will await your reply.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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