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M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Maxtec MaxO2(R)+AE Oxygen Analyzer quote Air Products PLC

1 message

Rowan,John <ROWANJ@airproducts.com>
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "Breslin,Jack" <BRESLIJ1@airproducts.com>
Kate,
Payment with credit card would be great thanks.
| assume that the analyser comes with a cell, if not then | would need one of these

| have attached a photo of what | require, see below

Can | supply you an alternative delivery address (this is for delivery only as card is logged to the OL112XY postcode)

Nestle (UK) limited

Marston Lane,

Burton-On-Trent

DE13 9LY

FAO Stores

C/O Air Products PLC (nitrogen plant)

¥
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Regards
AR /.
John

Phone: 0044 (0)1270 614334
Mobile: 0044 (0)7801178302

Follow our new PRISM® On-site gas generation page! Click here

Follow us: £ Twitter | £ YouTube |m LinkedIn

&

This communication is intended solely for the person addressed and is confidential and may be privileged. If you receive this communication incorrectly, plec
destroy all copies in your files. If you have questions, please contact the sender of this message.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 01 July 2021 09:29

To: Rowan,John <ROWANJ@airproducts.com>

Subject: [External] Re: Maxtec MaxO2(R)+AE Oxygen Analyzer quote Air Products PLC

This email is from an external source. Please exercise caution in opening attachments or links.

Hi John,

Thank you for your reply.

| will email you a proforma invoice later this morning. Upon receipt of payment, we would aim to ship the next working day.

We accept bank transfer, credit card payment (a colleague would ring you after you accept the proforma invoice) and PayPal (this would involve a fee of 6% of the total order which | wc

| will email you a proforma invoice shortly.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main offi
to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 1 Jul 2021 at 09:22, Rowan,John <ROWANJ@airproducts.com> wrote:

Many thanks Kate,

How can | proceed with payment of the items below and what would be the lead-time to the address below

MaxO2+AE Oxygen Analyser part number 0111261 (R217P72) £229 each, plus £10 carriage, plus VAT Currently in stock
Flow diverter R110P10-001 part number 0120095 £6.60 each Currently in stock
John Rowan
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14 Westbrook Close
Castleton
Rochdale
OL11 2XY

Regards

AIR _1.
PRODUCTS £=

John

Phone: 0044 (0)1270 614334
Mobile: 0044 (0)7801178302

Follow our new PRISM® On-site gas generation page! Click here

Follow us: £ Twitter | & YouTube |i.u.i LinkedIn

ENERGY

PRISM® on-site gas generation.
A bright idea for efficiency.

tell me more »

This communication is intended solely for the person addressed and is confidential and may be privileged. If you receive this communication incorrectly, p.
destroy all copies in your files. If you have questions, please contact the sender of this message.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths

Sent: 01 July 2021 09:18

To: Rowan,John <ROWANJ@airproducts.com>

Subject: [External] Re: Maxtec MaxO2(R)+AE Oxygen Analyzer quote Air Products PLC

This email is from an external source. Please exercise caution in opening attachments or links.

Good morning John,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The prices are as follows:

MaxO2+AE Oxygen Analyser part number 0111261 (R217P72) £229 each, plus £10 carriage, plus VAT Currently in stock
Case - soft "tight fit" part number R217P32 We are unable to supply this item

Operating instructions attached

Lanyard part number 0121300 Included with the Analyser

Flow Diverter (includes O ring) part number 0120099 Included with the Analyser

Flow diverter R110P10-001 part number 0120095 £6.60 each Currently in stock

T adapter RP16P02 part number 0120100 Included with the Analyser

V Mount assembly R217P35 part number 0131607 £8.25 each Not currently in stock

Please see attached leaflet that shows which items are included with the MaxO2+AE Oxygen Analyser.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance or if you require a proforma invoice with payment details or an official quotation.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main ¢
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 1 Jul 2021 at 07:05, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Rowan,John <ROWANJ@airproducts.com>

Date: Wed, 30 Jun 2021 at 20:03

Subject: Maxtec MaxO2®+AE Oxygen Analyzer quote Air Products PLC
To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

To whom this may concern,

Would you be able to supply me a quote, including delivery lead-time for the items below, also can you please indicate how | can pay for the items.

Part Number ltem
R217P72 MaxO2®+AE Oxygen Analyzer
R217P32 Tight Fit Case
R217M72 User’s Guide and Operating Instructions
RP76P06 Lanyard
R110P10-001 Flow Diverter
RP16P02 Blue Tee Adapter
R217P35 Dovetail Bracket
Viamed Ltd.
15 Station Road
Cross Hills
Keighley
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West Yorkshire
BD20 7DT
United Kingdom
Phone: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Company registered in England No. 01291765
Sales: sales@viamed.co.uk ,
Orders: orders@viamed.co.uk ,

General Enquiries: enquiries@viamed.co.uk ,

Regards

John Rowan

GG&ET EMEA Crewe (Europe)

Air Products PLC

2 Millennium Gate, Westmere Drive,
Crewe, Cheshire, England, CW16AP.
Phone: 0044 (0)1270 614334
Mobile: 0044 (0)7801178302

tell me more www.airproducts.co.uk

Follow us: ’ Twitter n Facebook uYouTube mLinkedln

Follow our new PRISM® On-site gas generation page! Click here

Follow us: £ Twitter | & YouTube |i.u.i LinkedIn

ENERGY tell me more >

PRISM® on-site gas generation.
A bright idea for efficiency. AIR .
PRODUCTS £=

This communication is intended solely for the person addressed, it is confidential and may be privileged. If you receive this communication incorrectly, please return it inmediately to the sender and destroy all copies in
this message.

Registered in England & Wales no. 103881. Registered Office: Hersham Place Technology Park, Molesey Road, Hersham, Walton on Thames, Surrey KT12 4RZ, England
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