M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

SV: 02 sensors
1 message

Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no> 29 June 2021 at 13:21
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan

Thankyou for Your speedy reply

2) Dispatch the 3 R-22VAN and cancel the R-33DE from your order?
The R 33 is only for Stock

| will order it at a later date
Hope i still have a little discount so its worth selling.

Have a terrific summer

Mvh.Ole Martin Lind

TIf. 48252188

Maskin og DykkerService

Molland 35, 4887 Grimstad

Org. Nr. 955874390

Aut. Salg og Service, teknisk instruktar
Scubapro Dykkerutstyr

Padi Dykkersenter

L&W HT. kompressorer

Karcher proff maskiner

Service gvrige maskiner

Fra: Ryan Swaine

Sendt: tirsdag 29. juni 2021 kl. 11:02
Til: Post Post Post

Emne: Re: 02 sensors

Hi Martin

Thank you very much for your email. | have amended our system so your account does not require prepayment, you
can pay for your orders within 30 days from the date of invoice.


mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:post@maskinogdykkerservice.no

We have the R-22VAN sensors available from stock.

| regret to inform you that we are currently out of stock of the R-33DE sensors. We are aiming to have them available
by the end of July/ early August. | am very sorry for the inconvenience, these sensors are nearly always available
from stock, but the pandemic has had an effect on production times.

Please can you let me know if you would like us to:

1) Dispatch the R-22VAN and leave your R-33DE on back order?

2) Dispatch the R-22VAN and cancel the R-33DE from your order?

3) Dispatch the complete order when all the items are available?

| will await your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 29 Jun 2021 at 09:15, Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no> wrote:
Good Morning
| have an account with you from earlier.

i expect an increase next year du to increased activity now and wish to have a logg on
account

also i need asap .

3 each R-22VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110232)

1 each R-33DE Oxygen Sensor (0110224)

If you can send the invoice directly to the accounting system that is prefered.
i hope i do not have to pay in advance due delays and so on.

invoice email: 854923069477080@voucher.24sevenoffice.com

Mvh.Ole Martin Lind

TIf. 48252188

Maskin og DykkerService
Molland 35, 4887 Grimstad
Org. Nr. 955874390 (VAT. NR.)


http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:post@maskinogdykkerservice.no
mailto:854923069477080@voucher.24sevenoffice.com

toll credit nr. 30316042

Aut. Salg og Service, teknisk instruktar
Scubapro Dykkerutstyr

Padi Dykkersenter

L&W HT. kompressorer

Karcher proff maskiner

Service gvrige maskiner



