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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Inquiry of Power Supply

1 message

Vince Wu <vince.wu@huilimedical.com> 28 June 2021 at 11:08
To: "Ryan Swaine <ryan. swaine@viamed. co. uk>" <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,
Please refer to the attached PO for power supply.
Please use our UPS account(46R27E) to send power supply by economic express, I will remit payment through
PayPal.

Best regards,
Vincent

Vince Wu <vince.wu@huilimedical.com> 於 2021年6月26日 週六 下午4:10寫道：

Hi Ryan,
Thanks for reply on this.


Please keep this one for me.
I will place order on Monday.


Best regards & stay healthy,
Vincent 



從我的iPhone傳送



Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 於 2021年6月25日 下午5:48 寫道：




﻿
Hi Vincent


I hope you and your family are keeping well.


The power supply in your picture is Version 2 (4420594), although these are no longer manufactured,
we do have one available from stock.


4420594 - V2 Power Supply = USD $50.45 each EXW


The Power supply will require one of the following adapter:
UK: 4430603
EU: 4430604
AUS: 4430605
US: 4430606


= USD $5.85 each EXW


Once this stock is depleted, we can only offer an upgrade on your device to be able to use the latest
version.


Best regards


Ryan


Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
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On Fri, 25 Jun 2021 at 10:13, Vince Wu <vince.wu@huilimedical.com> wrote:


Hi Ryan,
We had one power supply of Capnography VM2500S failed and would like to buy one for it?
Please refer to attached photo for the power supply.

Can you please send me price & leadtime?


Thanks & Regards,
Vincent





匯立醫療器材有限公司

Tel : 886 (03) 4910790

Fax: 886 (03) 4910795 
Mobile : +886 937 841039

http://www.huilimedical.com.tw



保密性聲明：

本信件及附件內容可能為機密性資料，且僅供原指定收信人使用。若您並非被指定之收信人或在
任何原因未經授權的情形之下收到本信件，請勿揭曉本信件內容於任何人，並請告知原發信人，
以及請從您的電腦刪除此信件及其所有附件。

Announcement of Confidential:

The information of this email is strictly confidential and
may be legally privileged.
It is intended
solely for the addressee. If you received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the
material from any computer.
Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of this
information by persons or entities other than the
intended recipient is prohibited.


-- 

Vincent Wu

匯立醫療器材有限公司
Tel : 886 (03) 4910790

Fax: 886 (03) 4910795 
Mobile : +886 937 841039

http://www.huilimedical.com.tw

保密性聲明：

本信件及附件內容可能為機密性資料，且僅供原指定收信人使用。若您並非被指定之收信人或在任何原因未經授權
的情形之下收到本信件，請勿揭曉本信件內容於任何人，並請告知原發信人，以及請從您的電腦刪除此信件及其所
有附件。

Announcement of Confidential:

The information of this email is strictly confidential and
may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the
addressee. If you received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the
material from any computer.
Any
review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of this information by persons or entities other than the
intended
recipient is prohibited.
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