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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

1 message

Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr> 24 June 2021 at 15:01
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Ok check for me please

 

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sarah Walton

Envoyé : jeudi 24 juin 2021 15:41

À : Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr>

Cc : import <import1@sielmed.ma>

Objet : Re: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

 

Dear José,

 

Unfortunately all invoices are required to state the product and the shipment separately, these can not be integrated.

 

If you would like me to quote a price for us to ship via our UPS courier, please let me know and I will amend the proforma
accordingly.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 24 Jun 2021 at 14:27, Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Is it possible for you to integrate the shipment on your proforma ?

Best regards

 

José Rodriguez

j.rodriguez@bioconnect.fr

Tél : 00.33.(0)4.67.03.42.67

Fax : 00.33.(0)4.67.87.10.62

Port : 00.33.(0)6.65.06.93.55

BIOCONNECT

1550 Avenue de Montpellier

34820 TEYRAN

www.bioconnect.fr
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