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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: RFQ. EyeMax™2

1 message

Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> 24 June 2021 at 11:38
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,

We need Packs.

80 X 20

60 X 20

20 X 2 0

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh

Sales Engineer

Modern Technology Company

P.O.Box 156

Beit Sahour

Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017

Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2021 12:50 PM

To: Mike Kharoufeh

Subject: Re: RFQ. EyeMax™2

 

Dear Mike,
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Thank you for your email.

 

Please can you confirm that the quantities you require are packs and not pieces?

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Thu, 24 Jun 2021 at 10:39, Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Please send us offer for the below and include the shipping cost via Tel Aviv Airport:

EyeMax™2 Phototherapy Mask – Regular. 

Model: R300P01 - Colour code: Blue

Occipital – frontal circumference 32-38cm. Pack of 20.

1114005 80

EyeMax™2 Phototherapy Mask – Premie. 

Model: R300P02 Colour code: Orange

Occipital – frontal circumference 26-32cm. Pack of 20.

1114006 60

EyeMax™2 – Micro.

Model: R300P03 Colour code: Green

Occipital – frontal circumference 20-26cm. Pack of 20.

1114007 20

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh

Sales Engineer



Modern Technology Company

P.O.Box 156

Beit Sahour

Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017

Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 1:37 PM

To: Mike Kharoufeh

Subject: Re: RFQ. Blender

 

Dear Mike,
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MAXBlend 2 - 0310291 = USD $1850.00 EXW

We would also recommend you purchase a mounting bracket:

Blender Bracket for Rail or Pole - 0320452 = USD $69.49 EXW



If you require hoses, please let us know what length and what gas outlets are being used in the hospitals.





Inspiration Blender - 0310200 = USD $1548.00 EXW

This includes a choice of mounting bracket (Rail or Pole), flow meter and hoses with BS Probes. Depending on the gas
outlet in the hospital, the price of the hoses may change.





We can also offer the MicroMax Blender:



1) MicroMax Lowflow Blender - part no. 5610151 = USD $672.95 EXW



2) Maxtec Bracket Pole/Rail - 0320452 = $69.49 EXW



3) Flowmeter options:

0-15 l/min Flowmeter (LH) - part no. 5620080 = USD $34.75 EXW (as you are looking at the blender face, this model
connects to the right side of the blender)

0-15 l/min Flowmeter (RH) - part no. 5620081 = USD $34.75 EXW (as you are looking at the blender face, this model
connects to the left side of the blender)

0-15 l/min Flowmeter (Straight) - part no. 5620082 = USD $34.75 EXW (this model can be connect to either side if the
blender, but is not as neat as the models above)



4) Flowmeter output connector - part no. 5620077 = $3.80 EXW



5) If you require hoses, please let us know what length and what gas outlets are being used in the hospitals.  

 

I have attached leaflets for your reference.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. 

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Sat, 13 Mar 2021 at 08:34, Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Could you please send us offer for the below :

Part number 0310291

Product name MaxBlend 2 Low Flow, 0 - 15 lpm Flow Meter (NIST)

Qty: 1

Part number 0310200

Product name Low Flow air/oxygen blender

Qty: 1

 

Best Regards

 

http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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Eng. Mike Kharoufeh

Sales Engineer



Modern Technology Company

P.O.Box 156

Beit Sahour

Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017

Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Friday, February 12, 2021 11:50 AM

To: Mike Kharoufeh

Subject: Re: O2 Sensor – GE – M-10

 

Dear Mike,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

We do have a compatible sensor, the R-30V.  The unit price for this sensor is $70.00 EXW.




Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: I am working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. 
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Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 12 Feb 2021 at 09:45, Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Could you please send us price of O2 Sensor – GE – M-10 .

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh

Sales Engineer



Modern Technology Company

P.O.Box 156

Beit Sahour

Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891
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