24/06/2021 Gmail - RE: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

2 messages

Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr> 24 June 2021 at 10:50
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Euros

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sarah Walton
Envoyé : jeudi 24 juin 2021 09:56

A : Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr>

Cc : import <import1@sielmed.ma>

Objet : Re: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

Dear José,
Thank you for your email.

Because BIOCONNECT is a new company, | am having to set you up on our system. Please can you advise whether
you will be paying in Euros and Dollars.

As soon as your account has been set up, | can send you a new proforma.

Cher José,
Merci pour ton e-mail.

Parce que BIOCONNECT est une nouvelle entreprise, je dois vous installer sur notre systéme. S'il vous plait pouvez-
vous indiquer si vous paierez en euros et en dollars.

Dés que votre compte est créé, je peux vous envoyer une nouvelle proforma.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
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On Wed, 23 Jun 2021 at 17:06, Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr> wrote:
Dear Sarah,
I check that with sielemd and | need you change the proforma to Bioconnect and not to sielmed.

My vat number is FR03502925209 ;

Best regards

José Rodriguez

j.rodriguez@bioconnect.fr
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Tél: 00.33.(0)4.67.03.42.67

Fax : 00.33.(0)4.67.87.10.62
Port : 00.33.(0)6.65.06.93.55
BIOCONNECT

1550 Avenue de Montpellier
34820 TEYRAN

www.bioconnect.fr

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sarah Walton
Envoyé : mercredi 23 juin 2021 08:56

A : import <import1@sielmed.ma>; Bioconnect (j.rodriguez) <j.rodriguez@bioconnect.fr>
Cc : Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr>
Objet : Re: DDE PAIEMENT ET ENLEVEMENT PIECE / VIAMED

Good morning,

Please find attached a proforma for payment of the 5 x R-48V sensors. Our bank details can be found at the bottom of
the PL.

Please can you advise which freight forwarder you will be using for this shipment so that | can add these details to the
order.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 22 Jun 2021 at 18:02, import <import1@sielmed.ma> wrote:

https://mail.

Bonjour Mr José,

Merci de vous charger du paiement et de I'enlévement d’une piéce aupres du fournisseur VIAMED dont les
coordonnées sont citées ci-dessous. A contacter Mme Sarah en copie et qui est déja au courant du dossier.

Il s’agit la réf 0110048 medical oxygen sensor R48V - quantité 5- au prix total de 200,00 $ EXW.
Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
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Adresse : 15 station road cross Hills- Keighley west Yorshire- BD20 7DT — Royaume uni
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Cordialement / Best regards / Mit freundlichen GriiBen / Melhores Cumprimentos / Saygilarimla

; SIELMED

U METHCAL AL COMFORT DE LA VIE

Mme Nadia EL HATTAB
Assistante Transit & tranport
SIELMED

N° 614 et 616 Boulevard AL QODS
Ain Choc Casablanca 20153
MOROCCO

Tel 212 522 52 39 34

Tel 212 522 21 70 89

Fax 212 522 52 39 35

Email : importi@sielmed.ma

Web : www.sielmed.com

ICE : 001459846000011

Circulaire des emballages/Palettes en Bois Applicable au Maroc a partir du 14/01/2019

Emballages en Bois doivent étre Neufs et répondre a la Norme NIMP15 (ou ISMP15-International Standard
for Phytosanitary Mesures)

Cicular of Wooden Packaging (Pallets) Applicable in Morocco from 14/01/2019
Wood packaging must be new and meet NIMP15 (or ISMP15-International Standard for Phytosanitary
Measurement)
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Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> 24 June 2021 at 10:57
Draft To: Contact Bioconnect <contact@bioconnect.fr>

Dear José,
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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