18/06/2021 Gmail - Fwd: PO A/210155 + Pending A/210128

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: PO A/210155 + Pending A/210128

2 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 18 June 2021 at 08:27
To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Administracion <administracion@prhoinsa.com>
Date: Fri, 18 Jun 2021 at 08:22

Subject: PO A/210155 + Pending A/210128

To: <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>

Dear Sarah,
I’'m attaching a new PO, A/210155, could you please send me the P.l. to make the payment?

Also, we have two boxes of reference 4420873 pending to be serve. Do you have them in stock at this point? If
possible, we would like to collect both orders together.

Thank you!

Leonor Jiménez

Dpto. Administracion
PRHOINSA

C/ JOSE ABASCAL 55, 2°D
28003 MADRID

Tel: 91 426 17 12
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