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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quotation Request
1 message

info@fairfield.ee <info@fairfield.ee> 16 June 2021 at 14:14
To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Dear Kate,


thank you for your prompt reply!

Yes please, send me the proforma invoice so we could make payment.

Can you inform me what is the approximate delivery time?

Please, use the details I provided earlier as the billing address and the shipment address will be as follows


Pilver Transport OÜ

Roobu tn. 9,

Maardu 74114

Estonia

Attn.: Fairfield Global OÜ

Contact person there will be Svetlana Shepikova tel. +3725538068


--

Yours sincerely,


Ms. Urve Talvistu


Managing Director

Fairfield Global OÜ


Kate Griffiths писал 2021-06-16 16:08:

Good afternoon Ms Talvistu,



Thank you for your enquiry.



The price of the R22-VA oxygen sensor, part number 0110039 is €32

each EXW.



Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing

carriage charges and insurance.  If so, can I use the address above

for your invoice and delivery address?



Many thanks.



Kind regards



Kate Griffiths



http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths



Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [1]

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd



Company registered in England, No. 01291765.



Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales

and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but

please continue to use email where possible.
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E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally

privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by

anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,

distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on

it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.



If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be

removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject

line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------



On Wed, 16 Jun 2021 at 13:26, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

wrote:




---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <info@fairfield.ee>

Date: Wed, 16 Jun 2021 at 13:23

Subject: Quotation Request

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>



Dear sirs,



our company is interested in purchasing your C81828-R22MATOM oxygen

sensors.

Can I please get a quotation for 50 pcs?



Please find our details below



Fairfield Global OÜ,

Harju maakond, Tallinn, Lasnamäe linnaosa,

Mahtra tn 30a, 13811, Estonia

Tel.: +372 6732 757

Reg. Nr.: 11690172

VAT Nr.: EE101426282



--

Yours sincerely,



Ms. Urve Talvistu



Managing Director

Fairfield Global OÜ






Links:

------

[1] http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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