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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Sensor Order

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Jun 11, 2021 at 11:17 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Neal Samet <neal@livetecsystems.co.uk>

Date: Fri, 11 Jun 2021 at 11:15

Subject: Sensor Order

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>


Hi There

 

Please can I order 4 x R22 Med Oxygen Sensors on our account:

 

Could you make sure to add to the invoice:

 

PO Number: L1414

Project Number: OPS Repair  

 

Quoted price over the phone was £36.00 per sensor totalling £144

 

 

 

Kind Regards

 

  Neal Samet Livetec Systems Ltd  

  Product Manager Unit 47A, Wrest Park, Silsoe, Bedford, MK45 4HS

  (+44)
07495 466 052 (+44)
01525 863 936 info@livetecsystems.co.uk

  neal@livetecsystems.co.uk www.livetecsystems.co.uk
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