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Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl>

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hey Ryan,
Yess, diving is picked up again...finally ;-)

The 202 with the quick-ox please.
Please ship these analysers asap :

2x VN202
2x TekOx
Thanks!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
Franciscusweg 10-1
1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl

Info@ScubaSupport.nl

KvK:321167830000
VAT-ID# NL001959467B52
Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

11 June 2021 at 07:49

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen

On Thu, 10 Jun 2021 at 18:27, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Eddy

Thank you very much. I'm guessing divers are dusting off their gear in anticipation of getting back into the water, as

we have had a sudden influx of orders :-)

| am very sorry to say that we still do not have any R-33S1 or R-33DE sensors available, as there have been
delays in manufacture. | am expecting to have the R-33S1 sensor for sometime late next week and we should have
some R-33DE sensors in 2-3 weeks. Would you like us to ship the analysers and the R-33VAN sensors straight

away?

Please can you confirm if you want the VN202 on it's own, with a DIN KIT or a Quick-OX?

| will await your reply.
Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 10 Jun 2021 at 15:45, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote:
Hey Ryan, hope you are well!
Here season is starting and the Netherlands are opening up again....thankfully ;-)

Can you please send me:

2x VN202
2x TekOx
2x R33DE
2x R33VAN

And if available, the sensors you did not have from my previous order.
Thanks!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support

Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499 Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax: +31 84-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000

VAT-ID# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen
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