10/06/2021 Gmail - Re: request for quote

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: request for quote
1 message

LAVINA DSA <lavinaomanmed@gmail.com> 10 June 2021 at 13:14

To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Dear Kate,

I would like to have as a Finger SpO2 sensor (hard shell) 0014651 standard FOC sensor .

The order from ALOKH has been forwarded for payment processing and the customer service will update you once
the payment are done.

Kind Regards,

Mrs.LAVINA DSA

Marketing Manager

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO LLC
P.0,BOX 1222,P.C.121, SEEB , SULTANATE OF OMAN
CONTACT :0096824593395, FAX:0096824596695

On Thu, Jun 10, 2021 at 1:03 PM Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Lavina,

Thank you for your clarification.

Before | can issue a proforma invoice with carriage charges, | need to ask you which free of charge probes
you require with the VM-2160?

The choices are as follows:

Silicone SpO2 sensor - adult 0014752

gzlicone SpO02 sensor - Medium (small adult) 0014754
gzlicone SpO2 sensor - paediatric 0014753

gzlicone wrap sensor 0014851

(I;;r sensor 0014850

Igirnger SpO2 sensor (hard shell) 0014651

| have attached a leaflet to help you decide.

Please could | also check that you are aware there is a proforma invoice already against your account -
MVM130867, by Alokh TA.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1693744777997371391%7Cmsg-f%3A170218203...
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10/06/2021 Gmail - Re: request for quote

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 10 Jun 2021 at 09:32, LAVINA DSA <lavinaomanmed@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
Sorry, | forgot to add the word finger sensor for pediatric.
please find below the part number of the items | need :

1)Part number :0014990

Product name:Viamed Paediatric Disposable Transpore SpO2 Sensor -6 boxes
2)Part number :0014753

Product name :Viamed SMARTsat Paediatric Silicone Finger Sensor for 6 pieces
Kind Regards,

Mrs.LAVINA DSA
Marketing Manager
OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO LLC

P.0,BOX 1222,P.C.121, SEEB , SULTANATE OF OMAN
CONTACT :0096824593395, FAX:0096824596695

On Thu, Jun 10, 2021 at 11:23 AM Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Lavina,
Thank you for your email.

| do not understand what you require when you say disposable paediatric finger pulse oximeters. The pulse
oximeters we sell are not disposable.

Please see link to our website and let me know which item you require.
https://www.viamed.co.uk
The search box is at the top left hand side.

The VM-2160, part number 0012165 is now in stock. | would be happy to issue you with a proforma invoice
once | know which other item you require.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1693744777997371391%7Cmsg-f%3A170218203...  2/4


mailto:lavinaomanmed@gmail.com
mailto:viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com
https://www.viamed.co.uk/
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd

10/06/2021 Gmail - Re: request for quote

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 10 Jun 2021 at 08:11, LAVINA DSA <lavinaomanmed@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
| would like to request from you a pricing for 11 pulse oximeters and also for a box of disposable peadiatric
finger pulseoximeter.
Please also let me know the delivery time for the product .

Kind Regards,

Mrs.LAVINA DSA

Marketing Manager

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO LLC

P.O,BOX 1222,P.C.121, SEEB , SULTANATE OF OMAN
CONTACT :0096824593395, FAX:0096824596695

On Tue, Mar 9, 2021 at 1:36 PM Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Lavina,
Thank you for your enquiry.

The price breaks for the hand held pulse oximeter VM-2160, part number 0012165 are as follows:

1-4 = $ 380.00 5-24 = $ 345.00 25-49 = $ 320.00 50 or more = $ 290.00
each each each each

Please let me know if you would like a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges etc.
We do not have fifteen in stock currently, but we are expecting stock soon.
Please see attached leaflet.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 9 Mar 2021 at 09:11, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: LAVINA DSA <lavinaomanmed@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 9 Mar 2021 at 05:47

Subject: request for quote

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir/Madam,
| would like to request a quote for 15 numbers handheld pulse oximeters .
Kind Regards,

Mrs.LAVINA DSA

Marketing Manager

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES COLLC
P.O,BOX 1222,P.C.121, SEEB , SULTANATE OF OMAN
CONTACT :0096824593395, FAX:0096824596695
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