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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Request For PI
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 8 June 2021 at 09:36
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: LAB <lab@omanmed.com>

Date: Tue, 8 Jun 2021 at 05:57

Subject: Request For PI
To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>, <accounts@viamed.co.uk>


Dear Sarah,

 

Kindly send Performa Invoice for below mentioned item

 

1.       Maxtec Oxygen Sensor MAX-250E………………….8 Nos

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks & Regards

Alokh T A

Biomedical Engineer

Mobile :(+968) 98083788/ lab@omanmed.com
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Oman Medical Supplies & Services Co. LLC. Office: 24593395 / Fax: 24596695 

P.O Box 1222, P.Code 121, Seeb, Sultanate of Oman

www.omanmed.com
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