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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: Purchase order H690819 
1 message

Lockey, David <David.Lockey@uhd.nhs.uk> 1 June 2021 at 14:34
To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Yes please proceed – I will amend our system to match.

 

Best Regards,

 

David Lockey | Operational Buyer – Non-Clinical

 

Commercial Services

0300 019 6278 | David.Lockey@uhd.nhs.uk | www.uhd.nhs.uk

     

University Hospitals Dorset

Royal Bournemouth and Christchurch Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Castle Lane East | Bournemouth | Dorset | BH7 7DW

 

Providing commercial, procurement and supply chain services on behalf of University Hospitals Dorset NHS
Foundation Trust

 

For all invoice payment queries please use the ‘’Ask ELFS AP Portal’’ which can be found here
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton 
Sent: 01 June 2021 12:37 
To: Lockey, David 
Subject: Re: Purchase order H690819

 

Hi David,

 

Yes we can change the order to 2 x 2810011 at £22.92 per unit.  

 

Are you happy for me to proceed?

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 1 Jun 2021 at 12:19, Lockey, David <David.Lockey@uhd.nhs.uk> wrote:

Good A�ernoon Sarah,

 

Apologies in the delay ge�ng back to you.

 

Please can we proceed with 2x item MD300-C2?

 

 

 

Best Regards,

 

David Lockey | Operational Buyer – Non-Clinical

 

Commercial Services

0300 019 6278 | David.Lockey@uhd.nhs.uk | www.uhd.nhs.uk

     

University Hospitals Dorset

Royal Bournemouth and Christchurch Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Castle Lane East | Bournemouth | Dorset | BH7 7DW

 

Providing commercial, procurement and supply chain services on behalf of University Hospitals Dorset
NHS Foundation Trust

 

For all invoice payment queries please use the ‘’Ask ELFS AP Portal’’ which can be found here
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton 
Sent: 28 May 2021 12:47 
To: Lockey, David 
Subject: Re: Purchase order H690819

 

Dear David,

 

I refer to the below email I sent on the 12th of May.  Please can you advise how you would like to proceed with
purchase order H690819?

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 May 2021 at 07:55, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning David,

 

Thank you for your purchase order H690819.

 

Please be advised that part number 2810052 has been discontinued.  I have added two links below of other finger
pulse oximeters that we have available.

 

https://www.viamed.co.uk/uk/?uid=&sessionid=&g=&i=2&mobile=&&page=productview&cat=354&
subcat=483&productid=2810011

The unit price for the MD300-C2 is £22.92 when purchasing 2 units.

 

https://www.viamed.co.uk/uk/?uid=&sessionid=&g=&i=2&mobile=&&page=productview&cat=354&
subcat=483&productid=2810050

The unit price for the MD300-C29 is £22.92 when purchasing 2 units.

 

I have placed your order on hold until you advise how you would like to proceed.
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Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered. 

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
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