27/05/2021 Gmail - Re: RFQ-OXYGEN SENSOR

M Gma |I Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: RFQ-OXYGEN SENSOR

2 messages

Lifepack Healthcare <lifepackhealthcare@yahoo.com> 26 May 2021 at 22:04
Reply-To: Lifepack Healthcare <lifepackhealthcare@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Thanks Kate.

Please is it possible you send us a revised proforma in Euro with your Euro bank details instead of
USD? Because of the value, its more convenient to pay in euro than in USD due to high tbank
transfer charges.

We saw Maxtec Max- 16 sensor with part number 0120416 on your website . Please can we have
the cost idea?

Thank you.
Best regards,

Oladayo J.Olaleye,

Lifepack Nigeria Limited

Plot 21 Block 47 Poluyi Street

llapo Estate, AIT Alagbado,

Lagos Nigeria.

Tel:+234 8056000276,234 14549546

This email is intended only for the person to whom it is addressed and/or otherwise authorized
personnel. The information contained herein and attached is confidential and the property of
Lifepack Nigeria Limited. If you are not the intended recipient, please be advised that viewing this
message and any attachments, as well as copying, forwarding, printing, and disseminating any
information related to this email is prohibited, and that you should not take any action based on the
content of this email and/or its attachments. If you received this message in error, please contact
the sender and destroy all copies of this email and any attachment. Please note that the views and
opinions expressed herein are solely those of the author and do not necessarily reflect those of the
company. While antivirus protection tools have been employed, you should check this email and
attachments for the presence of viruses. No warranties or assurances are made in relation to the
safety and content of this email and attachments. Lifepack Nigeria Limited accepts no liability for
any damage caused by any virus transmitted by or contained in this email and attachments. No
liability is accepted for any consequences arising from this email.

On Wednesday, May 26, 2021, 04:30:20 PM GMT+1, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Thank you for your postcode Oladayo,

| have added it to your proforma invoice and attached a copy.
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