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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Analox ATA Sensor 
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 24 May 2021 at 15:33
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Please check ups costs, based on 24x12x10cm 0.4kg

Ryan 

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Andre Shirley <andre@iantd.co.za> 
Date: Mon, 24 May 2021, 12:06 
Subject: Re: Analox ATA Sensor 
To: VadagraphRyanSwaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 
Cc: Don Shirley <don@iantd.co.za> 

Hi Ryan,

Please send me invoice for:

1 x Analox ATA Sensor. Part no. 0110238, R-22AT. 
1 x Mixcheck O2 Sensor. Part no. 0110215. R-33S1
1 x VN202 O2 sensor. Part no. 0110217. R-17VAN

And the GBP £58 UPS Courier costs. 

Address:
IANTD SA
Komati Springs
Road R38
Badplaas
1190
South Africa

Tel 082 650 2294 

Warm regards, 

André 

: André-Beverley: Shirley. 
: IT #673. 

: WEBSITE: www.iantd.co.za. 
: WEBSITE: www.technicaldivingafrica.com. 
: WEBSITE: www.komatisprings.com. 
: PHONE: CELL: +27 (0) 82 650 2294. 
: [E]MAIL: andre@iantd.co.za. 

On 15 Apr 2021, at 16:26, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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Dear André

It is nice to hear from you. We are well, thank you. I hope you are too.

The situation is hopefully improving, especially with the roll out of the vaccination, but we are still
currently in lockdown .

R-22AT =  GBP £35  each 

The only UPS service available to South Africa is Express Saver Service, and the cost for 1-2x sensors
would be GBP £58, it seems that the prices have increased recently, sorry.

Please let me know if you have any questions or if you would like to proceed with an order.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 15 Apr 2021 at 14:52, Andre Shirley <andre@iantd.co.za> wrote: 
Hi Ryan,
 
 
Hope all is well there? I’m keeping a keen eye on UK’s c0vid status.. 
Our lockdowns were run by clowns, but it seems we are better off than you guys - even though the
rest of the world thinks we have a “virulent strain”.. we are running around as (almost) normal with no
lockdowns - just the usual “keep your distances, wear a mask”… 
 
 
Anyway, a client is looking for a Analox ATA Sensor. Part no. 0110238, R-22AT. 
Can you please check what the shipment costs would be via courier please? (Not postal because our
postal system is defunct.)
 
 
 
 
Warm regards, 
 
André 
 
: André-Beverley: Shirley. 
: IT #673. 
 
: WEBSITE: www.iantd.co.za. 
: WEBSITE: www.technicaldivingafrica.com. 
: WEBSITE: www.komatisprings.com. 
: PHONE: CELL: +27 (0) 82 650 2294. 
: [E]MAIL: andre@iantd.co.za. 
 
 
 
 

On 07 Sep 2020, at 11:54, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
 
Hi Andre
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Yes, unfortunately we have been affected by the pandemic, as sensor production was
prioritised towards medical applications. However we are now starting to get stock and
we are working our way through the back orders. Our current lead time is
approximately 2 weeks.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Fri, 4 Sep 2020 at 06:49, Andre Shirley <andre@iantd.co.za> wrote: 

Hi Ryan,
 
 
I might have a sale for VN202 but just want to find out re availability of O2 cells for
it? 
Do you guys also have shortages? 
 
 
Warm regards, 
 
Andre Shirley 
IT #673 
 
www.iantd.co.za 
www.technicaldivingafrica.com 
www.komatisprings.com 
+27 (0) 82 650 2294 
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