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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM127430-1 
1 message

James Gough <no1calibrations@gmail.com> 21 May 2021 at 10:47
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Hello Sarah

Could we please order 25 as previously, Do you need to send a proforma invoice or do we qualify for a credit account as
we have ordered several times before?

Please use order "SMG0420" 

Many thanks 

Sandy 
No1 Calibrations
James Gough  - Engineer  07981 165 888
Sandy Gough  - Accounts  07974 115 990

no1calibrations@gmail.com

On Fri, May 21, 2021 at 9:32 AM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
Good morning,
 
Thank you for your email.
 
We do have stock of the R-22AV sensors and the unit price when purchasing 25 sensors is still £24.10.
 
Kind regards 
 
Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.  
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy   
 
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
 
Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
----------------- 
 

 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: James Gough <no1calibrations@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 21 May 2021 at 09:08 
Subject: Fwd: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM127430-1 
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk> 
 
 
Hello
 
Please find attached our last order with yourselves.
 
Could you please give us an up to date price and delivery timescale for the same again?
 
Many thanks for your help.
 
Sandy Gough 
No1 Calibrations
James Gough  - Engineer  07981 165 888
Sandy Gough  - Accounts  07974 115 990
 
no1calibrations@gmail.com
 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: <accounts@viamed.co.uk> 
Date: Fri, Dec 4, 2020 at 1:21 PM 
Subject: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM127430-1 
To: <no1calibrations@gmail.com> 
 
 
Please find attached invoice(s) from Viamed Ltd. 
 
Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.  
accounts@viamed.co.uk 
 
 
 
 
Regards  
Accounts Department  
Viamed Ltd  
accounts@viamed.co.uk 
 
Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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