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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Demand offer sensors 0110117 
2 messages

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Tue, May 18, 2021 at 10:25 AM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be>

Dear Isabelle, 

Thank you for your reply. 

This price is just for the sensor itself. 

Would you like me to go ahead and make you an official proforma with the transport costs? 

What documents do you require? We do not pay import duties. 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me. 

Kind regards 

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up  

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
----------------- 

On Tue, May 18, 2021 at 9:50 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote: 
 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> 
Date: Tue, 18 May 2021 at 09:41 
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Subject: FW: demand offer sensors 0110117 
To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be> 
 
 

Dear Zoey,

 

Thank you for the quick reply.

Does this price include transporta�on ( with the necessary documents) , and import du�es paid?

 

 

 

 

Met vriendelijke groeten,

Isabelle Vanherweghe 
Team Leader Sales Office  – Automo�ve & Industry

 

 

                                                                                                                        

Kortrijkstraat 174 - 8770 Ingelmunster  
D: +32 51 33 80 68 | T:  +32 51 31 18 12 | F:  +32 51 33 15 25

www.vandenabeele.be

 

 

 

 

Van: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Namens Zoey Teal 
Verzonden: dinsdag 18 mei 2021 10:35 
Aan: Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be> 
CC: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> 
Onderwerp: Re: demand offer sensors 0110117

 

Dear Marleen, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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The price for 25 x 0110117 would be €31.00 each.  

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Tue, May 18, 2021 at 8:24 AM Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be> wrote:

Dear Zoey,

 

Please send me your best prices for the oxygen sensors 0110117

as we purchased in the past (25 pieces). Our Account number 00007716.

 

Met vriendelijke groeten,

 

Marleen Sergoyne 
Process Manager

                                                                                                                         

Kortrijkstraat 174 - 8770 Ingelmunster  
D: +32 51 33 15 02 | T:  +32 51 31 18 12 | F:  +32 51 31 20 20

 

 

Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> Tue, May 18, 2021 at 10:34 AM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey

 

Can you give us an indica�on of the transport cost?

With all the necessary documents to be in order to pass the border.

 

 

 

Met vriendelijke groeten,

Isabelle Vanherweghe 
Team Leader Sales Office  – Automo�ve & Industry
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Kortrijkstraat 174 - 8770 Ingelmunster  
D: +32 51 33 80 68 | T:  +32 51 31 18 12 | F:  +32 51 33 15 25

www.vandenabeele.be

 

 

 

 

 

Van: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Namens Zoey Teal 
Verzonden: dinsdag 18 mei 2021 11:26 
Aan: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> 
Onderwerp: Demand offer sensors 0110117

 

Dear Isabelle, 

 

Thank you for your reply. 

 

This price is just for the sensor itself. 

 

Would you like me to go ahead and make you an official proforma with the transport costs? 

 

What documents do you require? We do not pay import duties. 

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, May 18, 2021 at 9:50 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> 
Date: Tue, 18 May 2021 at 09:41 
Subject: FW: demand offer sensors 0110117 
To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be>

 

Dear Zoey,

 

Thank you for the quick reply.

Does this price include transporta�on ( with the necessary documents) , and import du�es paid?
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Met vriendelijke groeten,

Isabelle Vanherweghe 
Team Leader Sales Office  – Automo�ve & Industry

 

 

                                                                                                                        

Kortrijkstraat 174 - 8770 Ingelmunster  
D: +32 51 33 80 68 | T:  +32 51 31 18 12 | F:  +32 51 33 15 25

www.vandenabeele.be

 

 

 

 

Van: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Namens Zoey Teal 
Verzonden: dinsdag 18 mei 2021 10:35 
Aan: Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be> 
CC: Isabelle Vanherweghe <isabelle.vanherweghe@vandenabeele.be> 
Onderwerp: Re: demand offer sensors 0110117

 

Dear Marleen, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

The price for 25 x 0110117 would be €31.00 each.  

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, May 18, 2021 at 8:24 AM Marleen Sergoyne <marleen.sergoyne@vandenabeele.be> wrote:

Dear Zoey,

 

Please send me your best prices for the oxygen sensors 0110117

as we purchased in the past (25 pieces). Our Account number 00007716.

 

Met vriendelijke groeten,

 

Marleen Sergoyne 
Process Manager
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Kortrijkstraat 174 - 8770 Ingelmunster  
D: +32 51 33 15 02 | T:  +32 51 31 18 12 | F:  +32 51 31 20 20
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