12/05/2021 Gmail - Fwd: R-33S1

M Gmail Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: R-33S51

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 May 2021 at 09:25

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Xpriotog Molidng ka1 ZIA EE - MDC <info@pozidis.gr>

Date: Wed, 12 May 2021 at 07:31

Subject: RE: R-33S1

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

We need to order 2pcs. Can we pay by credit card (sending you all necessary information) or shall we make a bank
transfer?

Kind Regards,

Public Relations Department

MR G

MEDITERRANEARN DIVE CENTER

Address: 95 Alexandrou Papanastasiou str., Piraeus, P.C. 18533, Greece
Phone: +30 210 41 25 376 / +30 210 42 27 537 / +30 213 040 2590
Fax: +3021042 27 025

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, 10 May, 2021 3:07 PM

To: XproTtog Modgidng kai ZIA EE - MDC <info@pozidis.gr>

Subject: Re: R-33S1

Dear MDC
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The R-33S1 trade price is GBP £35 each EXW. The Airmail cost for 1-2 sensors would be £12.

I do not believe there would be any duties, but your local VAT is likely to be payable upon import, depending on the
country there can sometimes be a charge for administration.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 10 May 2021 at 12:17, XpAoTog NMoZidng kai ZIA EE - MDC <info@pozidis.gr> wrote:

Good afternoon.

Can you please inform us on the trade price for Oxygen sensor R-33S17? Please inform us, also, on the shipping
cost and if they will be any custom fee.

Kind Regards,

Public Relations Department

MG

MEDITERRANEAN DIVE CENTER

Address: 95 Alexandrou Papanastasiou str., Piraeus, P.C. 18533, Greece
Phone: +30 210 41 25 376 / +30 210 42 27 537 / +30 213 040 2590

Fax: +30 21042 27 025
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