05/05/2021 Gmail - Fwd: New order

M Gma" Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: New order

3 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, May 5, 2021 at 1:43 PM

To: Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>
Date: Wed, 5 May 2021 at 13:39

Subject: RES: New order

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Julice Cruz <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>

Hi Kate
Please send us proforma

INSPIRAR COMERCIO DE VENTILADORES PULMONARES LTDA
PC Professor Julio dos santos, 68

Varginha

City Itajuba

Zip code 37501-098

fedex account 796386118

ID 37.061.424/0002-57

Thanks,

Y2 TACOM ¢ .
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Vania Cristina

Coordenacgéo de Compras e Importagao

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028

Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Em nome de Kate Griffiths
Enviada em: quarta-feira, 5 de maio de 2021 05:00

Para: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>

Assunto: Re: New order

Good morning Cristina,

Thank you for your email.

The price of part number 0131202, black oxygen sensor cable is $20 each EXW.

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice, if so would you be paying by Paypal?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and |
am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to
use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 4 May 2021 at 18:07, Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br> wrote:

Hi Kate,

Please give me link to order 01 cable reference 0131202

Inspirar comercio de ventiladores pulmonares

Thanks,

Vania Cristina

Coordenagéo de Compras e Importacédo
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Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028

Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com> Wed, May 5, 2021 at 2:31 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

To: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>

Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Cristina,

Please can you confirm if you would like to pay by paypal and also if you will be using your own Fedex account? If so,
please can you confirm the account number so | can add this to your proforma?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]

Vénia Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br> Wed, May 5, 2021 at 2:35 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk, vania220370@gmail.com, Julice Cruz <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>
Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Yes, | will use our fedex account 796386118 and payment by paypal.

[Quoted text hidden]
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