
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor inquiry 
1 message

Kathleen Russell <kathleen@divemahara.com> 5 May 2021 at 04:01
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan

Thank you! Below I filled in our info. 

I’d like to order the oxygen sensor for my oxycheq and 2 TEC-OX (manual OFF). 

And send instructions  for payment on invoice and delivery. 
I need the oxygen sensor urgently. My whatsapp is +971565358883 

Many thanks 
Kathleen Russell

On Tue, 4 May 2021 at 2:44 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
Hi Kathleen
 
 
Company name: Al Mahara Diving Center LLc 
Address: (mailing) PO Box 52149 Abu Dhabi and physical address for courier 215 Villa, Al Mina Road, Abu Dhabi,
UAE  
telephone: landline +971 2643 7377 and company mobile/whatsapp is +971565358893 
accounts contact...etc ; account email: accounts.ho@divemahara.com landline number: +971 2643 7377
Yes please 
 
I have attached leaflets for both the VN202 and TEK-OX. If you are just using the device to analyze cylinders, then
the TEK-OX is probably the best option, as it is easy to use with a single handed operation. If you wish to use the
device as part of your filling system as well as analysing cylinders, then the VN202 is often better, as the sensor is
separated from the monitor via a cable.
 
Please feel free to give me a call anytime on the numbers below.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Sat, 1 May 2021 at 06:51, Kathleen Russell <kathleen@divemahara.com> wrote: 

Hi Ryan,
 
What info would you like from me?
Company name
Address 
telephone 
accounts contact...etc 
 
Can I call you for payment ?
 
Can I get a simple oxygen analyzer for our enriched air diving and retail 
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Many thanks 
 
Best regards,
Kathleen Russell 
PADI Course Director/Starguard Elite Instructor Trainer
Al Mahara Diving Center
Mobile +971 56 5358883
www.divemahara.com
 
Find us @DiveAbuDhabi on Facebook, Instagram, Twitter
 
 
On Wed, Apr 21, 2021 at 1:52 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Thank you Kathleen
 
Please just send me your details when you are ready.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Wed, 21 Apr 2021 at 10:46, Kathleen Russell <kathleen@divemahara.com> wrote: 

That would be great, thank you.
 
On Wed, 21 Apr 2021 at 1:24 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Hi Kathleen
 
We don't have a payment link, but please can you send me your complete delivery/invoice details, I will
put you on to our system and then call you for CC details if that would be okay?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Wed, 21 Apr 2021 at 10:20, Kathleen Russell <kathleen@divemahara.com> wrote: 

Dear Ryan,
 
This is great news. thank you and if you can provide a payment link, we can send the payment via credit
card also 
 
Thank you and we can see what other products and services you have to offer.
 
Best regards,
Kathleen Russell
 
PADI Course Director/Starguard Elite Instructor Trainer
Al Mahara Diving Center
Mobile +971 56 5358883
www.divemahara.com
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Find us @DiveAbuDhabi on Facebook, Instagram, Twitter
 
 
On Tue, Apr 20, 2021 at 1:31 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Dear Kathleen
 
Thank you for your email and I apologise for the delay in reply.
 
As you are a dive centre, I would be happy to extend to you our trade pricing, the R-22AEX is GBP
£35
 
Postage to the UAE is currently subject to a surcharge due to limited transportation during the
pandemic, the cost by Airmail Tracked & Signed would be GBP £16
 
Total = GBP £51
 
If you would like to proceed with an order, please let me know your complete delivery/invoice details
and I will prepare a proforma invoice for you. Payment can be made by either bank transfer or
credit card.
 
With regards to KISS sensors, unfortunately we do not offer any sensors suitable for use in
rebreathers. I am sorry I can not be of more help with this.
 
I look forward to hearing from you and please let me know if you have any questions.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Fri, 16 Apr 2021 at 09:54, Kathleen Russell <kathleen@divemahara.com> wrote: 

Hi Ryan 

Greetings from Abu Dhabi  

Lex from NL have me your contact as we are a dive center looking for R-22AEX oxygen sensor
with a 3 pin molex connector and do you have oxygen sensor  
K1D small oxygen sensors for the KISS Sport CCR  

Can you let me know if you have any of the above available.  

Many thanks,  
Kathleen Russell 

PADI Course Director/ Starguard Elite Instructor Trainer/ EFR Instructor Trainer/Reef Check UAE 
Artificial Reef Project Director 
Al Mahara Diving Center  
Abu Dhabi  
Office +971 50 1118125 
Direct mobile +971 56 5358883 (whatsapp) 
Email: kathleen@divemahara.com

--  
Kathleen Russell 
 
PADI Course Director and Starguard Instructor Trainer and Artificial Reef projects, Reef Check Eco Diver
Trainer 
 
Mobile +971 56 5358883 
Al Mahara Diving Center  
www.divemahara.com 

--  
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Kathleen Russell 
 
PADI Course Director and Starguard Instructor Trainer and Artificial Reef projects, Reef Check Eco Diver Trainer 
 
Mobile +971 56 5358883 
Al Mahara Diving Center  
www.divemahara.com 

--  
Kathleen Russell 

PADI Course Director and Starguard Instructor Trainer and Artificial Reef projects, Reef Check Eco Diver Trainer 

Mobile +971 56 5358883 
Al Mahara Diving Center  
www.divemahara.com 
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