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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: New order
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 5 May 2021 at 09:29
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: alex <alex@bubble-diving.com> 
Date: Tue, 4 May 2021 at 20:55 
Subject: RE: New order 
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 

Hello

We would like to order you following units

0110217 R-17VAN QTY 5

Oxygen sensor R-33DE QTY 4 

Take care
 
Alexandre
 
06 40 19 16 18
alex@bubble-diving.com
BUBBLE DIVING
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De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> de la part de Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 
Envoyé : lundi 19 août 2019 13:29 
À : alex 
Objet : Re: New order
 
Hi Alexandre

Thank you for your order, I am pleased to inform you that it was shipped on the 13th and your card has been debited. I
have attached your invoice which includes the tracking number.

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.

Best regards

Ryan 

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 18 Aug 2019 at 15:12, Alexandre de Bubble Diving <alex@bubble-diving.com> wrote: 

Hi Ryan

Did you charge our CB ? did you already send it ? Could you send us the invoice

Have a nice day

Alexandre

BUBBLE DIVING

Le 13.08.2019 14:00, Alexandre de Bubble Diving a écrit :

Hi Ryan

Airmail - Tracked & Signed = £12-£14

Best regards

Alexandre

Le 13.08.2019 13:57, Ryan Swaine a écrit :

Hi Alexandre
 
Airmail = £8-£9 
Airmail - Tracked & Signed = £12-£14
UPS = £16 (set price for up to 20kg)
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
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Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Tue, 13 Aug 2019 at 12:48, Alexandre de Bubble Diving <alex@bubble-diving.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan

You can us the same credit card.

What is the difference cost for transport.

Have a nice day

Alexandre

Le 13.08.2019 12:59, Ryan Swaine a écrit :

Hi Alexandre
 
Thank you very much. 
 
Are you happy for us to use the same credit card as last time?
 
Would standard airmail be okay or would you prefer a tracked service or UPS?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Tue, 13 Aug 2019 at 11:22, Alexandre de Bubble Diving <alex@bubble-diving.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan 
 
May I push you a new order for 5 R33DE (9100-9220-9B) 
payment by Credit card 
Have a nice day 
Alexandre 
BUBBLE DIVING

 

--  

 

 

--  

 

 

-- 
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