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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Website question 
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 April 2021 at 14:58
To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Karina Shah <karinapajo@googlemail.com> 
Date: Thu, 29 Apr 2021 at 14:56 
Subject: Re: Website question 
To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 

Hi Kate,
Thank you for reply.
I would like to order one box of 12 wraps for now at the cost of £12.90 plus VAT.
Can you please send pro for a invoice or alternatively I can call and give my card details over the phone.

Delivery and invoice address is  Karina Shah, 20 Victoriana way, Birmingham, B20 2SZ. 

Kind Regards,
Karina Shah
Tel 07534989927
Sent from my iPhone

On 29 Apr 2021, at 14:33, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Good afternoon Karina,

Thank you for your enquiry via our website.

The price breaks for the posey wraps (6554), part number 0021013, pack of 12 are as follows:

1 = £12.90 2 = £10.40 each 3 - 10 = £9.65 each 11 or more = £9.40

Other box sizes also available.

Carriage is free to a UK address and all prices are excluding VAT.

Please let me know if you would like a proforma invoice.  If so, I would need your delivery and invoice
addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.
   
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible. 
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