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M Gma |I Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: O2 sensors
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 April 2021 at 12:46

To: Kate Giriffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Andreea Ghizdavu <andreea.ghizdavu@abbmed.ro>

Date: Wed, 28 Apr 2021 at 12:44

Subject: Re: 02 sensors

To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Bogdan Brici <bogdan.brici@abbmed.ro>, Petrut Rotarescu <petrut.rotarescu@abbmed.ro>

Dear Kate,

My name is Andreea Ghizdavu, | am in charge for the orders.

Please find attached the payment confirmation for our proforma invoice.
We need some changes regarding the delivery and invoice address.
Please find the correct data below:

Delivery address:

ABB MEDTEC

Brasov, Romania, Nicolae Titulescu Street, NO. 2, Floor 2, Carpatex Building, Postal code 500010
Person of contact Bogdan Brici - +40727335170

Invoice address:

ABB MEDTEC

Rasnov, Romania, Garofitei Street, No. 2, Postal Code 505400
VAT Number RO34944232

Person of contact for the invoice - you can pass me instead of Petre Rotarescu and my phone number - 40744375633.
Thank you very much.
Looking forward to hearing from you soon.

Best regards,

Cu stima / Kind regards,

Andreea Ghizdavu

Office Manager

ABB MEDTEC SRL, Romania

Tel.: +40 744 375 633

E-mail: andreea.ghizdavu@abbmed.ro
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