27/04/2021 Gmail - Re: NEW ORDER /MASTERMED /DUBAI 04-04-2021

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: NEW ORDER /MASTERMED /DUBAI 04-04-2021

2 messages

Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> 27 April 2021 at 15:50
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,
Please update the proforma invoice with below sensor also additional so i can make payment today
R22Vi Oxygen sensor -qty 2

R43V Oxygen sensor -QTY 8

Update this items to existing proforma so we can finish the order today you can ship out tomorrow

Thanks & regards
Roshil
MASTERMED

On 27/04/21 07:34 AM, Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Roshil,

| can confirm that all sensors are currently in stock.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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