27/04/2021 Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230421

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Purchase order number E1/230421

1 message

Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> 27 April 2021 at 10:57
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,

Please send everything by UPS Standard. Insurance is not needed. By Polish law UPS is responsible for parcels anyway
once invoice is attached and value is declared. Please make sure it will be one invoice listing all items in the box. I'm
sorry but UPS does not like when stuff is put on a few invoices.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa
Oxylink
Mobile: +48 509 701 509

pon., 26 kwi 2021 o 12:33 Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):
Dear Piotr,

Please find attached two order confirmations. Weight, dimensions and cost can be found on each one.
Date codes are as follows:-

R-47V - Jan 2021

MAX-250 - Sept & Oct 2020
MAX-16 - Aug 2020
MAX-250TM - Oct 2020
MAX-250E - Sept 2020
R-24MED - Mar 2021
OOM111 - Nov 2020

R-23V - Nov 2020 & 2021
MAX-3 - Jun 2020

R-48V - Sept 2020

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 23 Apr 2021 at 11:28, Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Grand. Thank you Sarah.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards
Piotr Podkowa

Oxylink

Kom.: +48 509701509

pt., 23 kwi 2021, 12:24 uzytkownik Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat:
Dear Piotr,

Thank you for confirming.

I have now processed your order. Once Cathy has given me the weights and dimensions, | can provide you with a
price for UPS Standard and UPS Express Saver so you can compare with TNT.

We will also check date codes and if any sensors have an older date, | will let you know.

If you do not hear from me today, | will email you first thing Monday morning with all the information. Is this OK
with you?

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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On Fri, 23 Apr 2021 at 10:00, Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Hi Sarah,

Sorry, the customer finally got back to me regarding MAX-3 sensors.
| will take 10x MAX-3 and 10 x R-48V sensors instead of 20x MAX-3 originally ordered.

| will need 30x R-17AV sensors.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa
Oxylink
Mobile: +48 509 701 509

pt., 23 kwi 2021 o0 10:55 Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):
Dear Piotr,

Please can you confirm the quantity of R-17AV sensors you require?
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 23 Apr 2021 at 07:39, Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Please supply:
1

Sénsor type: R-22MED
Qty: x150
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2

Sensor type:

Qty: x100

3

Sensor type:

Qty: x50

R-47V

MAX-250

P/N: 0110425

4.
Sensor type
Qty: x10

5

Sénsor type:

Qty: x5

6

Sensor type:

Qty: x20

7

Sénsor type:

Qty: x5

8

Sensor type:

Qty: x15

9

Sénsor type:

Qty: x2

9

Sensor type:

Qty: x20

1.

Sensor type:

Qty: x6

12.

Sensor type:

Qty: x10

13.

Flow sensor

MAX-16

MAX-250TM

Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230421

MAX-3 or R-48V (50/50 is acceptable)

MAX-250K

MAX-250E

MAX-250A

R-24MED

OOM111

R-23V

P/N: 4310002
Qty: 2 boxes of 5

It would be nice if you could have a box containing numbers 3-12 and sensors Teledyne R-17AV on

Tuesday at latest? | will organize a collection.

Rest of the sensors (numbers 1-2 and 13) should be ready by the end of the next week.

All sensors must be fresh!

Please confirm?

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa

Oxylink

Mobile: +48 509 701 509
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