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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen Sensor 
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 25 April 2021 at 11:41
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Please provide them with a proforma invoice.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Dan (Gasbolaget AB) <dan@gasbolaget.se> 
Date: Thu, 22 Apr 2021 at 17:24 
Subject: Sv: Oxygen Sensor 
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 

Hello, yes proceed with order.

Our VAT is SE556415251901

We will pay by bank transfer, send IBAN and swift.

Thank you.

 

Best Regards

 

Dan Steinland

Gasbolaget i Dalarna AB

Ragvaldsberg 4

SE-791 96 FALUN

Sweden

Mobil: +46 (0)70-796 80 55

www.gasbolaget.se
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Från: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> För Ryan Swaine 
Skickat: den 22 april 2021 18:20 
Till: Dan (Gasbolaget AB) <dan@gasbolaget.se> 
Ämne: Re: Oxygen Sensor

 

Hi Dan

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

We would be happy to supply you at our trade pricing, as you are a reseller:

 

R-17VAN = GBP £35 each EXW

 

Postage by airmail for 2x sensors = GBP £12

 

Total for 2x R-17VAN = GBP £82

 

If you would like to proceed with an order, please let me know your company EORI/VAT number and I will prepare a
proforma invoice for you. Payment can be made by either bank transfer or Credit Card. The sensors are available from
stock and would be dispatched within 1-2 days of receipt of payment.

 

Please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 22 Apr 2021 at 17:07, Dan (Gasbolaget AB) <dan@gasbolaget.se> wrote:
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Hello, I need 2 Pcs of Part number 0110217 R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor. Can I order them from
you?

We are an reseller of gas equipment in middle of Sweden.

 

Our Name Gasbolaget means The Gas company Corp.

 

Best Regards

 

Dan Steinland

Gasbolaget i Dalarna AB

Ragvaldsberg 4

SE-791 96 FALUN

Sweden

Mobil: +46 (0)70-796 80 55

www.gasbolaget.se
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