21/04/2021 Gmail - Re: Re: Website question

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Re: Website question

1 message

thewlis@mail.com <thewlis@mail.com> 20 April 2021 at 16:06

To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Hi Kate,

So sorry for not getting back to you sooner. Yes [ still require the items and invoice. Can | pay by
card? If so please let me know what | need to do.

Kind regards
Sarah

Sent from my Android phone with mail.com Mail. Please excuse my brevity.

On 20/04/2021, 14:52 Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com> wrote:
Good afternoon Sarah,

Just a quick email to ask if your proforma invoice is still required? It expires on May 1st, at
which point | am required to delete it. | can of course issue a new proforma invoice at any time.

| await your reply.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will
be answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
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