21/04/2021

Gmail - Re: EX-WORKS CHARGE//UK

On Wed, 21 Apr 2021 at 09:24, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

-- Forwarded message ---------

From: UK Air Exports <airexportuk@europeanfreightlimited.com>
Date: Wed, 21 Apr 2021 at 09:21

Subject: RE: EX-WORKS CHARGE//UK

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

We have been nominated to collect this shipment on behalf of your buyer in India. Kindly
confirm readiness of goods along with

Total 4 Pkgs.

Gross weight : 69 Kgs.

Dimension of each Pkt : 61x47x47cm
Commodity : Spares for Medical Equipment

Is cargo ready for collection

timings at collection point (we require a min of 7 hours window for collection)
Contact name and telephone at collection point post code

Final weight

Final dims of each piece

HS Code

Is the shipment under export control// license // IPR//bonded clearance?
collection postcode and full address

Collection reference number

Do you have a forklift to load? Y/N

Any specific vehicle requirements

Are the goods packed in a stackable condition?

Does the cargo have type of batteries or any components considered Hazardous?

Kindly provide us a copy of Invoice and packing list for subject shipment

Thanks & Regards

Shachi

European Freight Limited

Unit 5, Bldg. X2

Eastern Perimeter Rd

Hatton Cross, London
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