
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: order 
1 message

Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> 20 April 2021 at 08:53
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Yes here life is picking up again.

Yes, please the complete order on hold till the Max250+ is available please Ryan!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards, 

Eddy van Vliet -  Scuba Support  
Franciscusweg 10-1
1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499            Info@ScubaSupport.nl 
Fax:     +31 84-8307700           www.ScubaSupport.nl 
________________________________________________

KvK:321167830000                    

VAT-ID# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp  

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen 

On Mon, 19 Apr 2021 at 18:25, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
Hi Eddy
 
Thank you very much, I hope you are keeping well.
 
The MAX-250+ sensor is out of stock, I have an order in for a couple with the manufacturer, but I expect it will be
4+ weeks, do you want to keep them on back order?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Mon, 19 Apr 2021 at 16:00, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote: 

Hey Ryan, how are you doing?
 
I would like to order:
 
2x Max250+
3x R33VAN 
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1x R33van RP
2x R22AT
2x R22DEM
2x R33S1
2x Tekox analyser 
6x blue T-piece
 
Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards, 
 
Eddy van Vliet -  Scuba Support  
Franciscusweg 10-1
1216SK Hilversum
 
Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.
 
Phone: +31 356313499            Info@ScubaSupport.nl 
Fax:     +31 84-8307700           www.ScubaSupport.nl 
________________________________________________
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