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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Invoice Duchy Hospital 
Daniel Lear <daniel.lear@willsbridgeconsultancy.com> Wed, Apr 14, 2021 at 12:51 PM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Tom Ladds <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Hi Zoey,

This was for rental on 2 cases. Please just charge as per the quotation.  

Sent from my iPhone

On 14 Apr 2021, at 12:20, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

[Quoted text hidden]
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