08/04/2021

Gmail - Re: New Order

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: New Order

1 message

houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> 8 April 2021 at 10:25

To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Kate
Please issue the invoice under TechnoMed s.ar.l but the use the same shipping address of the old

order .

We will pay by paypal.

Thanks
Hussein

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 8, 2021, at 11:38, Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Hussein,

| hope you are well.

Before | issue your proforma invoice, please could | ask if your new company name is
TechnoMed s.a.r.I? Also, your last order was in £ and using PayPal. Would you like
me to use £ and PayPal this time?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use email
where possible.
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