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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: New Order 
1 message

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 8 April 2021 at 09:37
Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
To: houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com>

Good morning Hussein,

I hope you are well.  

Before I issue your proforma invoice, please could I ask if your new company name is TechnoMed
s.a.r.l?  Also, your last order was in £ and using PayPal.  Would you like me to use £ and PayPal
this time?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Thu, 8 Apr 2021 at 09:24, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Houssein
 
Thank you very much for your email, I hope you are keeping well.
 
We would be very happy to supply you with the O2 sensors for position 1 & 2. Unfortunately we
do not supply the items in positions 3, 4 & 5.
 
1) T-7V
2) R-49V
Both are available from stock.
 
My colleague Kate will be in contact with a proforma invoice.
 
Please let us know if you have any questions.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
 
 
On Wed, 7 Apr 2021 at 21:45, houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Ryan

Happy Easter for you and your team .

 

Thanks to issue a purchase order for :

1-      T-7V-0110058 quan�ty 1 ( for SternMed Respirator )

2-      Raphael Oxygen Sensor quan�ty 5

3-      IF Available ( Expiratory Valve Assembly for SternMed as a�ached )

4-      If Available ( Flow Sensor for SternMed as a�ached )

5-      IF Available ( Expiratory Vavle for galileo )
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INVOICE TO : TechnoMed s.a.r.l

Address : Beirut -  Ras El Nabeh – Al Shaar Street – facing Carlos Al Mondelek – Luna
Building – 2nd Floor

Phone : 009613939512 / 009613125919 / 0096170353512

 

Will pay via paypal transfer from England .

 

 

Best Regards

___________________________

Hussein  Ghandour

TechnoMed s.a.r.l

Tel: +961-3-125919 | +961-70-353512

E-Mail: H-Ghandour@hotmail.com

 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine 
Sent: Thursday, April 01, 2021 12:34 PM 
To: houssein ghandour 
Subject: Re: Photos

 

Dear Hussein

 

Thank you, I can confirm that our T-7V would be a suitable replacement:

 

T-7V - 0110058 = USD $31.50 each EXW

We have the T-7V available from stock.
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Best regards

 

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Thu, 1 Apr 2021 at 10:14, houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan  
Attached photos .
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