M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: PO VM1-2021

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Apr 6, 2021 at 11:42 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Sophie

It looks like they only require a certificate of origin: 9910001, but you can ask them if they need an invoice stamped by
the chambers of commerce, this would be the same cost as the 9910001.

If they need an Authorisation Letter stamped by the embassy, we will have to get a quotation for them, but | suspect they
can use the same one as last time.

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 6 Apr 2021 at 11:18, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ryan - please can you let me know which document part numbers and prices | will need to add to this Proforma
please?

Their last order (IN159667 - 2018) had :

9910000 Documentation. Authorisation letter stamped by Embassy of Kuwait - $118.38
9910000 Documentation. Stamped invoice by Chambers of Commerce - $65.00

Will it be the same?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow office staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate
and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may
be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Tue, Apr 6, 2021 at 9:12 AM

Subject: Fwd: PO VM1-2021

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ethel Lobrio <e.lobrio@medyvision-kw.com>

Date: Sun, 4 Apr 2021 at 08:57

Subject: PO VM1-2021

To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Ibrahim Hindi <i.hindi@medvision-kw.com>, Anish Kurian <a.kurian@medvision-kw.com>, Mona Bisheer
<mona.bisheer@medvision-kw.com>, Abdul Kaiyum <info@medyvision-kw.com>, Noor Sultan <n.sultan@medvision-
kw.com>

Dear Ryan
Good Morning and Happy Easter!

Please find attached our new order. Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email & send us the proforma invoice.

Thank You & Best Regards

Ethel Lobrio
Sales Coordinator

MEDVISION wesica services co

15th Floor, Al-Jon Tower, Fahad Al Salem St, Kuwait City
P.O. Box 26332 Safat 13124, Kuwait

Mob: (+965) 66339140

Office: (+965) 22022228 ex.137

Fax: (+965) 22022229

Email: e.lobrio@medvision-kw.com

Web: www.medvision-kw.com
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