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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

NEW ORDER /MASTERMED /DUBAI 04-04-2021 
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Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae> 4 April 2021 at 20:56
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,

  Please send us the proforma invoice for following 

1.  R-22Vi  Oxygen sensor -QTY 4 

2. R-47V  Oxygen sensor -QTY 4 

3. R-30V Oxygen sensor -QTY 4 

4. R-17V Oxygen sensor -Qty 4

5. R-45V Oxygen sensor -QTY 2 

Together with this order  , you can ship previous pending sensors 10 x R-24MED sensors   also 

Thanks & regards
Roshil
MASTERMED 

On 23/03/21 04:22 PM, Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Roshil, 

I am writing to inform you that your orders will be dispatched later on today. 

You can track your orders on the UPS website, www.ups.com, with the following tracking number
1Z9W96380444285091.
   
Please see attached delivery notes and copies of the invoices.

We will ship the remaining 10 x R-24MED sensors once stock has arrived. 

Kind Regards  

Sarah Walton 
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are currently working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will.  
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