01/04/2021 Gmail - Fwd: Sensor Order

M Gma" Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: Sensor Order

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Thu, Apr 1, 2021 at 2:00 PM

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Neal Samet <neal@livetecsystems.co.uk>
Date: Thu, 1 Apr 2021 at 13:58

Subject: Sensor Order

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Catherine Allen <allen@livetecsystems.co.uk>

Hi There
Please can | order 7 x R22 Med Oxygen Sensors on our account:
Could you make sure to add to the invoice:

PO Number: L1326
Project Number: PJ12

Quoted price over the phone was £36.00 per sensor totalling £256

Kind Regards

Neal Samet

Product Manager iIVET E

Phone: +44 1525 863936
Mobile: +44 7495 466 052

Email: neal@livetecsystems.co.uk

www.livetecsystems.co.uk
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