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M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Website question

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 31 March 2021 at 09:11

To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <thewlis@mail.com>

Date: Wed, 31 Mar 2021 at 09:05
Subject: Re: Website question

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning Kate,

Thank you for your reply. | have moved from Manchester Road to a new address. My new
address is 64 Stamford Street, Mossley, OL5 OHS.

| wish to purchase 2 of the O2 sensors. If you could send me an invoice and let me know how
best to pay for the items, | would appreciate this.

Kinds regards

Sarah Thewlis

Sent from my Android phone with mail.com Mail. Please excuse my brevity.

On 30/03/2021, 12:58 Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Sarah,

Thank you for your enquiry via our website.
Part number 0110015, R-15 sensor has been superseded by part number 0110014, R-15V

The price breaks for the R-15V oxygen sensor are as follows:

[1=£42.00 |[2=£38.00 each ||3-10=£36.00each [[11 or more = £ 34.00 each |

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors and all prices are excluding VAT. This item is
currently in stock.

Please let me know if you would like a proforma invoice, | would need to check your address is
still the same, your last order was in 2016.

Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the
main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but
we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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