30/03/2021 Gmail - Fwd:

M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd:

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Mar 30, 2021 at 3:27 PM

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffitths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we send Jumah a proforma invoice. Distributor USD pricing.
Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 30 Mar 2021 at 15:23

Subject:

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

GOOD DAY RYAN
HOPE YOU ARE DOING WELL &SAFE
IT'S POSSIBLE TO MAKE PI FOR ULTRAMA O2 QTY 3

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan
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