
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: VN202 
1 message

Nautilus UK <info@nautilus.uk> 22 March 2021 at 18:14
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

Could you please send an invoice for four analysers and wall mounts please.

Delivery to:

Nautilus
Unit 11 Top Floor
Heath House Mill
Heath House Lane
Bolster Moor
Huddersfield
HD7 4JW

Thanks 

Brett Thorpe
Nautilus 

0333 444 0104 | 07811 500 300

info@nautilus.uk

www.nautilus.uk

On 11 Mar 2021, at 15:04, Nautilus UK <info@nautilus.uk> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

You too. Thanks for that, I quoted them this morning. 

Brett Thorpe
Nautilus 

0333 444 0104 | 07811 500 300

info@nautilus.uk

www.nautilus.uk
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On 11 Mar 2021, at 10:52, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Brett

Nice to speak to you yesterday.

I have attached the leaflet for the VN202 and some images of the wall mount bracket.
Please find the trade pricing below:

VN202 (manual switch off) - 7910110 = £110.00
Universal mounting plate - 0022171 = £15.30
Wall Bracket (metal) - 0121180 = £12.00

Please just let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
<VN202 mkII Spec Sheet 2019-07-31 (email).pdf><VN202 with wall Bracket.zip>
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