15/03/2021 Gmail - Re: Order:Automotive Oxygen Cells, Type R-22AVG

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Order:Automotive Oxygen Cells, Type R-22AVG

1 message

GEAS <geascal@gmail.com> 15 March 2021 at 11:22

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Kate,

Please repeat the order: 50 units @ £19.75 ea, maximum voltage 13mV. Awaiting your proforma
invoice for payment today.

Please ensure delivery address is:-

GEAS

c/o The Big Kitchen
100 High Street
Portishead

BS20 6AJ

Regards,

Steve Webb

GEAS

Unit 4 Banwell Court
169 High Street
Worle
Weston-super-Mare
BS22 6JA

07811 175072

On Mon, 15 Mar 2021 at 10:30, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Steve,
Thank you for your email.

The price breaks for the R-22 AVG, part number 0110182 are as follows:

1-9=£26.75(10-24 = £ 25-49 =¢£ 50-99 =£ 100 or more =£
each 23.00 each 20.50 each 19.25 each 17.75 each

Please let me know if you would like your proforma to show the quantity as 40 or 50. Carriage
would be £10 either way.

This item is in stock. Delivery would be made after payment has been received. The BACS
details would be on the proforma invoice. | have noted your new delivery address.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1694288456417959227%7Cmsg-f%3A16942968413113...
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| look forward to hearing from you regarding quantity.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the

main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we

aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,

please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 15 Mar 2021 at 09:09, GEAS <geascal@gmail.com> wrote:
Kate,

| need to order another consignment of 40 only Oxygen Cells, ref Invoice RVM 126472-1.
Please can you advise price & delivery. Obviously if unit price is cheaper for order 50 cells,
please advise. Trusting you have stocks.

Please also advise on Payment. Terms.

Delivery address has changed to:-
GEAS

c/o The Big Kitchen,

100 High Street

Portishead

BS20 6AJ

Regards,
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Steve Webb

0781 117 5072
GEAS

Unit 4 Banwell Court
169 High Street
Worle
Weston-super-Mare
BS22 6JA

07811 175072

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A 16942884564 17959227 %7Cmsg-f%3A16942968413113... 3/3



