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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Order 20VO0135 
1 message

Info Kurka.Med <info@kurka.cz> 12 March 2021 at 10:36
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,
 
I am sending you the order in the a�achment. 
Please send us a proforma invoice and add the shipping fee. 
Many thanks.
 
Best regards 
Eva Kurkova
 
Ing. Eva Kurková
mob: +420 603 167 599
e-mail: eva.kurkova@kurka.cz
 
Kurka.Med s.r.o.
Pelušková 1349, 198 00 Praha 9
Tel: +420 241484670, fax: +420 241480976
www.spirometry.cz
 

From: Info Kurka.Med [mailto:info@kurka.cz]  
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 6:09 PM 
To: 'kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk' 
Subject: RE: Website question 

Dear Kate,
 
Thank you for your informa�on. I am sending you the order in the a�achment.  
Please send us a proforma invoice and add the shipping fee please. 
What is the delivery �me? Thank you a lot.
 
Best regards 
Eva Kurkova
 
Ing. Eva Kurková
mob: +420 603 167 599
e-mail: eva.kurkova@kurka.cz
 
Kurka.Med s.r.o.

mailto:eva.kurkova@kurka.cz
http://www.spirometry.cz/
mailto:info@kurka.cz
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
mailto:eva.kurkova@kurka.cz
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Pelušková 1349, 198 00 Praha 9
Tel: +420 241 484 670, +420 603 167 599
www.spirometry.cz
 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths 
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 12:07 PM 
To: info@kurka.cz 
Subject: Website question 

Good morning Eva,

Thank you for your enquiry via our website.

The price of item 0110081, UFO 130-2 oxygen sensor is  €149.05 EXW when purchasing x3.  The
other price breaks are as follows:

1 = € 175.35 each 2 = € 157.82 each 3-10 = € 149.05 each 11or more = € 140.28 each

The above prices are in euros, but I can provide the prices in dollars if you prefer.

We are expecting more stock to be available in the coming weeks.

If you require a proforma invoice, I would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set
up a new account for you.

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main
office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to
continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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