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Re: REQUEST QUOTE

1 message
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 11 March 2021 at 11:19
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: SUNDIAL MEDICAL EQUIPMENT <sundialuae@gmail.com>
Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, SUNDIAL <sundial@eim.ae>, Ranjitha Sugumar
<ranjithasundial@gmail.com>, Rony Thomas <ronysundial@gmail.com>
Dear Ayswarya Jose
Thank you very much for your email.
Our distributor pricing is the best we can offer on these sensors:
MAX-250 - 0110425 = USD $69.00 each EXW - | am pleased to say that we have plenty of stock available.
My colleague Sarah will be in contact very soon with a proforma invoice.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 11 Mar 2021 at 11:11, SUNDIAL MEDICAL EQUIPMENT <sundialuae@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

I trust you are doing good.

Please provide us the quote for;

1.0110425 Oxygen Sensor MAX-250 with O Ring, Quantity: 22 pieces. This is for use
with the Vapotherm Precision Flow Device.

Request a special price with a 15% discount considering_ our continuous orders.

Delivery: Immediate, We will arrange collection by UPS
Payment: will be wire transferred in advance, please provide the Pro-forma invoice.

Best Regards
Ayswarya Jose
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