10/03/2021 Gmail - Fwd: UFO130-2 Sensors

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: UFO130-2 Sensors

1 message

Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> 10 March 2021 at 08:11

Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

These are yours.

I only replied on behalf of you when you were off x

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: EGM Fiser <vyvojari.fiser@egmenergo.cz>
Date: Wed, Mar 10, 2021 at 7:58 AM

Subject: Re: UFO130-2 Sensors

To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
| would like to order another pair for our test:

1pc UFO130-2 O2 Sensor - part no. 0110081 = $131.50

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=97ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A 1683514 1397823367 15%7Cmsg-f%3A16938318146313...
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1pc UFO130-2 PCB - part no. 0111002 = $295.00

Please send me a proforma invoice if you would like to be paid in advance.
Our address is as follows:

EGMedical, s.r.o.

Building 12A

19 Krenova Street

602 00 Brno

Czech Republic, European Union

VAT ID: CZ26216043

Best regards,
dipl. Ing. Ondrej Fiser

EGMedical, s r.o.

19 Krenova Street

602 00 Brno

Czech Republic, European Union

¢t 26. 11. 2020 v 17:45 odesilatel Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> napsal:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your reply.

Unfortunately the lead times are longer at the moment as manufacture is still prioritised towards sensors for ventilators
and CPAP devices for the fight against the pandemic. The UFO PCB is not normally a stock item so will always have a
lead time.

Moving forward, if you have a regular requirement we could try and carry stock but would need some kind of expected
numbers in advance.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards
Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders
may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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