M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

RE: O2 Sensor

1 message

Sofiane SAYAHI <sofiane.sayahi@actia-engineering.tn> Tue, Mar 9, 2021 at 12:20 PM
To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie,

Thanks for the proforma invoice, could you please update it just for 2 samples?

We will proceed to testing and prototyping at this first stage of the project.

Regards.

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sophie Lines
Envoyé : mardi 9 mars 2021 12:38 PM

A : Sofiane SAYAHI <sofiane.sayahi@actia-engineering.tn>

Objet : Fwd: O2 Sensor

Dear Sofiane,
Please find attached your Proforma Invoice for 5x 0110704 (Oxygen sensor MLF-16) including postage to Tunisia.

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow office staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Mon, Mar 8, 2021 at 2:51 PM

Subject: Re: O2 Sensor

To: <sofiane.sayahi@actia-engineering.tn>

Dear Sofiane,

Thank you for your email.

I can confirm the price for part number 0110704 (Oxygen sensor MLF-16) is 77.50 EURO. There would be a 4-6 week
lead time from receipt of payment.

I will be in touch with your quotation/proforma document, which will include carriage costs etc.

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me
Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow office staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542


http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
mailto:sofiane.sayahi@actia-engineering.tn
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sofiane SAYAHI <sofiane.sayahi@actia-engineering.tn>
Date: Mon, 8 Mar 2021 at 13:12

Subject: O2 Sensor

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,
We are working on a medical ventilator project and we are looking for an external O2 sensor.
Could you please send us a quotation of 5 units of the “ITG MLF-16 Lead-free Oxygen Sensor” Ref : 01107047

Thank you.

Regards.

SOFIANE SAYAHI

R&D Engineer

GSM : (+216) 98 790 468

ACTIA®

ACTIA Engineering Services (siége social)
Parc Technologique "ElI-Ghazala"

1 Rue Newton, BP99 - 2088 ARIANA (Tunisie)

http://www.actia.com
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